RelaDyne/Pumpelly Oil

Acquisition

Lard Oil Company Inc

Miguez Fuel & Lubricants

Brittney Palomino
337-304-3021

Wade Stephens
225-664-3311

George Aitken
337-201-1910

Bid Item: BULK OIL cherokeeserviceslc@gmail.com wstephens@lardoil.com gaitken@miguezfuel.com
SB-2023-PW-150 Final Louis Augustine Joey LeBlanc Miguez Fuel
337-625-1117 337-558-7247 337-365-3784
Effective Period: May 1, 2024 until October 30, 2024 Lcsales@reladyne.com jleblanc(@]lardoil.com
Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference
Item# Engine Oils UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, SW30 Quart 3.53 3.61 5.66
2 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, SW30 5 gallon No bid 59.25 89.66
3 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, SW30 55 gallon 646.25 610.75 815.20
Oil Brand: Mobil Phillips 66/Shield Choice
Oil Type: Special S/B 5SW30 5w30
4 (B) Super All Season Group Il Engine Oil, 10W30 Quart 4.00 3.61 5.66
(B) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 10W30 5 gallon| No bid 59.25 No bid
6 (B) Super All Season Group Il Engine Oil, 10W30 55 gallon No bid 610.75 815.20
Oil Brand: Mobil Phillips 66/Shield Choice
Oil Type: Special S/B 10W30 10W30
7 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 Quart 5.39 No bid 6.09
(C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 5 gallon 68.75 73.25 96.93
9 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 55 gallon 708.95 760.75 866.00
10 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 Bulk per gallon 11.25 11.65 13.20
Oil Brand: Mobil Philllips 66/Fleet EC
Oil Type: Delvac HDEO 15W40 15W40
11 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 Quart 4.48 No bid No bid
12 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 5 gallon 71.25 73.25 95.20
13 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 55 gallon 769.45 760.75 901.20
14 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 Bulk per gallon| 12.28 11.65 14.29
Oil Brand: Mobil Phillips 66/Kendall
Oil Type: Delvac HDEO 15W40 Super D-XA 15W40
15 (E) Shield Choice Engine Oil SW20 Quart 4.57 3.61 5.66
16 (E) Shield Choice Engine Oil SW20 5 gallon No bid 59.25 No bid
17 (E) Shield Choice Engine Oil SW20 55 gallon 635.25 610.75 937.48
18 (E) Shield Choice Engine Oil SW20 Bulk per gallon 10.43 9.15 14.53
Oil Brand: Mobil Phillips 66/Shield Choice
Oil Type: Special S/B 5W20 SW20
19 (F) Mobil 1 FS Oil 0W40 Quart 8.13 7.71 No bid
20 (F) Mobil 1 FS Oi1l 0W40 5 gallon No bid No bid No bid

Oil Brand: Mobil

Oil Type: Mobil 1 FS 0W40
21 (G) Versa Trans ATF Quart No bid 6.66 6.70
22 (G) Versa Trans ATF 5 gallon| No bid No bid No bid
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66/Kendall
Oil Type: Multivehicle ATF Versa Trans LV
23 (H) Dexron-VI Automatic Transmission Oil 5 gallon| No bid 5.81 6.70
24 (H) Dexron-VI Automatic Transmission Oil Bulk per gallon 16.71 17.14 No bid
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66/Kendall
Oil Type: Dexron VI Versa Trans LV
25 (I) Triton Synthetic Transoil 50 5 gallon 244.65 213.25 169.11
26 (I) Triton Synthetic Transoil 50 Bulk per gallon 51.66 38.65 42.36
Oil Brand: Mobile Citgo
Oil Type: Delvac 1 Trans 50 Citgear HD Syn 50
27 (J) Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran 5 gallon 67.95 68.25 75.38
28 (J) Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran Bulk per gallon 12.00 11.45 12.78
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips/Kendall
Oil Type: Mobilfluid 424 Power Tans
29 (K) Universal Gear Lubricant 80-90 5 gallon| 67.45 128.25 111.44
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: 5 Mobilube HD Plus 80W90 MP Gear 80W90
30 (L) Universal Gear Lubricant 85-140 5 gallon| 67.45 128.25 111.44
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: Mobilube HD Plus 85W140 MP Gear 85W140
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31 (M) Triton Synthetic Transoil (75-90) Quart No bid 11.41 No bid
32 (M) Triton Synthetic Transoil (75-90) 5 gallon 258.30 193.25 173.16
Oil Brand: Mobile Citgo
Oil Type: Delvac 1 Gear 75W90 Citgear HD Syn 75W90
33 (N) Castrol (10W-30) Quart 5.69 3.61 5.66
34 (N) Castrol (10W-30) 5 gallon| No bid 59.25 No bid
35 (N) Castrol (10W-30) 55 gallon No bid 340.75 815.20
36 (N) Castrol (10W-30) Bulk per gallon No bid 9.15 14.82
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66/Shield Choice
Oil Type: Special S/B 10W30 10W30
WASTE OIL - PER GALLON PRICE BIDDER WILL PAY THE PARISH (CPPJ) FOR ITS WASTE OIL - AS IS
Price Per Gallon Price Per Gallon Price Per Gallon
Ttem# Facility Bidder Will Pay Bidder Will Pay Bidder Will Pay

37 (O) Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 1000 gallons

(East and West Maintenance Facilities) Price per gallon No bid No bid No bid
38 (O) Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 150 gallons

(Mosquito Control) Price per gallon No bid No bid No bid
39 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 2.5 gallon 11.25 10.75 13.00
40 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 5 gallon No Bid 27.00 No bid
41 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Bulk per gallon 3.13 2.20 2.49
Oil Brand: Old World Blue Sky
Oil Type: TRP Clean Blue/Blue DEF DEF
42 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) Quart 4.13 6.61 5.86
43 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) 5 gallon 71.10 113.25 105.44
44 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) Bulk per gallon| 12.57 19.65 13.29
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: Delvac 1230 T5X-HD30
45 ® Mobilgard 12 Series (SAE 30) 5 gallon No bid No bid 5.86
46 ® Mobilgard 12 Series (SAE 30) Bulk per gallon| No bid 20.65 105.44
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: Mobilguard 312 T5X-HD30
47 (S) Megaflow TM 20 Series (DTE 26) 55 gallon No Bid 579.75 715.47
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: Nuto H 68 Megaflow AW-68
48 (T) DTE 20 Series (DTE 26) 55 gallon 673.75 579.75 715.47
Oil Brand: Mobile Phillips 66
Oil Type: Nuto H 68 Megaflow AW-68
49 (U) Mobil Delvac 1 Automatic Transmission Fluid Quart No bid 12.91 No bid
50 (U) Mobil Delvac 1 Automatic Transmission Fluid 5 gallon No bid 263.25 190.55
Mobile Phillips 66
Delvac 1 ATF Triton HD ATF
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