Bid Title:

Bid Number:
Effective:
Department:

Plastic Pipe

SB-2024-PW-127

May 24, 2024 - December 31, 2024
Division of Engineering & Public Works

Vendor Vendor
Eunice Coastal Culvert &
Supply, Inc. Coburns Supply
Terry Brown Michael Self

337-546-6887

225-369-3395

337-546-6889 (f)

337-474-0987 (f)

sales@coastalculvert.com

mself@coburns.com

Price Per Foot BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name: Price Brand Name: Price
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Per foot ADS Per foot
1 12 9.04 /ft 8.90 /ft
2 15 12.95 /ft 12.75 /ft
3 18 17.00 /ft 16.70 /ft
4 21 No bid /ft No bid /ft
5 24 29.15 /ft 28.60 /ft
6 30 43.25 /ft 42.40 /ft
7 36 54.92 /ft 53.85 /ft
8 42 71.55 /ft 70.18 /ft
9 48 85.22 /ft 83.58 /ft
10 60 155.00 /ft 151.87 /ft
Price Per Band, Each BANDS BANDS
Price Price
Brand Name: Per Brand Name: Per
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Band ADS Band
11 12 17.00 each 16.15 each
12 15 30.00 each 26.90 each
13 18 50.00 each 45.88 each
14 21 No bid each No bid each
15 24 70.00 each 64.70 each
16 30 165.00 each 150.40 each
17 36 235.00 each 209.30 each
18 42 350.00 each 306.40 each
19 48 400.00 each 359.68 each
20 60 750.00 each 559.52 each
Price Per Tee BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name: Price Brand Name: Price
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Per Tee ADS Per Tee
21 12 250.00 each 213.80 each
22 15 318.00 each 319.60 each
23 18 444.00 each 448.35 each
24 24 685.00 each 693.18 each
25 30 1,390.00 each 1,398.87 each
26 36 2,000.00 each 1,881.85 each
27 42 2,950.00 each 2,731.16 each
28 48 3,500.00 each 3,214.12 each
29 60 7,700.00 each 6,794.65 each
30 12x12x12 riser 250.00 each 213.80 each
31 15x15x12 riser 309.00 each 312.32 each
32 18x18x12 riser 358.00 each 362.60 each
33 24x24x12 riser 525.00 each 531.80 each
34 30x30x12 riser 770.00 each 779.35 each
35 15x15x15 riser 318.00 each 319.60 each
36 18x18x15 riser 429.00 each 433.58 each
37 24x24x15 riser 585.00 each 591.80 each
38 30x30x15 riser 840.00 each 849.30 each
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90 Degree Fitting BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name: Price Brand Name: Price
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Per Fitting ADS Per Fitting
39 12 175.00 each 166.92 each
40 15 205.00 each 201.15 each
41 18 300.00 each 282.23 each
42 21 No bid each No bid each
43 24 584.00 each 558.10 each
44 30 1,471.00 each 1,155.10 each
45 36 1,824.00 each 1,539.05 each
46 42 2,814.00 each 2,253.00 each
47 48 3,411.00 each 2,713.18 each
48 60 5,454.00 each 4,716.28 each
45 Degree Fitting BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name: Price Brand Name: Price
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Per Tee ADS Per Tee
49 12 214.00 each 189.55 each
50 15 195.00 each 174.30 each
51 18 257.00 each 232.26 each
52 21 No bid each No bid each
53 24 525.00 each 474.38 each
54 30 814.00 each 738.75 each
55 36 1,247.00 each 1,131.55 each
56 42 1,788.00 each 1,610.28 each
57 48 2,230.00 each 2,063.32 each
58 60 3,500.00 each 3,130.87 each
Miscellaneous BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name:
Price NDS Round Black Price
Item # Product Per Unit Plastic Grate Per Unit
59 Plastic Yard Grate 12" 172.00 each 80.00 each
60 Plastic Yard Grate 15" 223.00 each 130.00 each
HP Storm Pipe BID PRICE BID PRICE
Brand Name: Price Brand Name: Price
Item # Size (diameter, in.) ADS Per Foot ADS Per Foot
61 12 11.52 /ft 10.44 /ft
62 15 15.95 /ft 14.78 /ft
63 18 20.99 /ft 19.87 /ft
64 21 No bid /ft No bid /ft
65 24 32.38 /ft 30.70 /ft
66 30 48.88 /ft 46.36 /ft
67 36 64.00 /ft 60.75 /ft
68 42 84.55 /ft 78.32 /ft
69 48 108.00 /ft 102.38 /ft
70 60 154.25 /ft 146.35 /ft
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