Bid Title Water Testing Ch Vendor Vendor Vendor
. oy Thornton, Musso & United Mineral &
Bid Number SB-2024-PW-122 Hawkins Inc. i Inc. Chemical Corp.
Effective Period June 7, 2024 until November 30, 2024 Chip Nolan Dustin Musso Michael Prelevic

337-884-3755

337-344-1358

201-507-330 x 239

chip.nolan@hawkinsinc.com

dustin@tmbwater.com

mprelevic@umccorp.com

Tyler Mitchell Hallie Musso Aida Pleho
337-884-9186 337-315-7386 201-507-330 x 224
tyler.mitchell@hawkinsinc.com orders@tmbwater.com apleho@umccorp.com
Item Description Container Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Needed $1.0845/1b
(Pumped Off Truck) $9.67/gal| No Bid No Bid
I Sodium Permanganate 10% or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time S No Bid No Bid
Product Name Sodium Permanganate 10% No Bid No Bid
15 gallon $0.7915/Ib
$6.81/gall No Bid No Bid
1T Acetic Acid/Hydrogen Peroxide or Equivalent 30 gallon $0.6092/1b
$5.24/gal| No Bid No Bid!
Anticipated Lead Time 5 days No Bid No Bid!
Product Name Acetic Acid / Hydrogen Peroxide No Bid No Bid
As Needed $0.7882/1b
(Pumped Off Truck) $8.67/gal| $1.90/1b No Bid
il Zinc Orthophosphate or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time S 7-10 days No Bid
Product Name Zinc Orthophosphate (Z0190-ZC). TMB-439 No Bid
As Needed $0.4428/1b| $0.76/1b 1-15,0001bs
(Pumped OfF Truck) $4.28/gal| 0.60/1b 15,0001bs + over| No Bid
v Sodium Hypochlorite or Equivalent Antici . .
ipated Lead Time 5 days 7-10 days No Bid
Product Name Azone - EPA Reg No. 7870-1 TMB-5651 No Bid
1 gallon $0.70/1b|
$6.77/gal| No Bid No Bid|
v Hydrochloric Acid 20 or Equivalent 30 gallon $0.70/1b
$6.77/gal| No Bid No Bid
Anticipated Lead Time 5 days. No Bid No Bid
Product Name Hydrochloric Acid 20" No Bid No Bid
100 pound pail $3.2549/1b $500 (501b pail) $1.35/Ib!
VI Calcium Hypochlorite Granular or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 5 days 7-10 days 3 days ARO
Product Name Crystal Clear 68 TMB-54 HI-CLEAR|
150 Ib cylinder
(price to include any rental
VII Chlorine Cylinders or Equivalent cost of cylinder) $1.9580/1b No Bid No Bid
Anticipated Lead Time 5 days. No Bid No Bid
Product Name Chlorine No Bid No Bid
45 pound pail $5.5445/1b $432 (501b pail) No Bid
Vi Calcium Hypochlorite Tablets or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 5 days 7-10 days No Bid
Product Name Calcium Hypochlorite 2.5" TMB-545 No Bid!
As Needed $1.2473/1b|
(Pumped Off Truck) $13.67/gal No Bid No Bid
X Aqua Hawk 117 or Equivalent . N _ _
Anticipated Lead Time 5 days No Bid No Bid!
Product Name Aqua Hawk 117 No Bid No Bid
As Needed $1.2613/Ib
(Pumped Off Truck) $13.51/gal No Bid No Bid
X Aqua Hawk 457 or Equivalent . N . .
Anticipated Lead Time 5 days No Bid No Bid
Product Name Aqua Hawk 457 No Bid No Bid!
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) No Bid $1.80/Ib No Bid
XI TMB 901 or Equivalent . -
or Lquivaient Anticipated Lead Time No Bid 7-10 days No Bid
Product Name No Bid TMB-901 No Bid
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