Bid Title: Collection Sewer Pipe & Fittings Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Waterworks Coburns Supply Core & Main LP
Bid Number: SB-2024-PW-126 Final 337-269-0032 337-625-3300 225-369-3395 225-756-4122
Effective: July 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024 Bryan L g Keith Dyson ichael Self Shane Carson

Dept Personnel:

Division of Engineering & Public Works

337-269-1130 F

337-474-0987 F

225-756-4144 F

blavergne@winwaterworks.com

keith.dyson@ferguson.com

mself@coburns.com

shane.carson@coreandmain.com

Item # Description Product Code Brand Name Price uom Product Code Brand Name Price UOM | Product Code Brand Name Price UOM | Product Code Brand Name Price uom
1 1” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 1.08 /ft P40BEPG20 Sanderson 1.60 /ft 03929 IM Eagle .56 /ft no bid /ft
2 11/4” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 1.37 /ft P40BEPH20 Sanderson 2.00 /ft 03930 IM Eagle 1.23 /ft no bid /ft
3 11/2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 1.72 /ft P40BEPJ20 Sanderson 2.40 /ft 03931 IM Eagle 0.89 /ft no bid /ft
4 2” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 2.22 /ft P40BEPK20 Sanderson 2.70 /ft 03932 JM Eagle 1.14 /ft no bid /ft
5 2” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300214 Sanderson 1.59 /ft SDR26PK Sanderson 1.40 /ft 47300124 Sanderson 1.40 /ft no bid /ft
6 2 1/2” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 3.78 /ft P40BEPL20 Sanderson 4.50 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
7 3” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300165 Sanderson 2.56 /ft SDR26PM Sanderson 2.37 /ft 47300165 Sanderson 2.27 /ft no bid /ft
8 3” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 4.52 /ft P40BEPM20 Sanderson 4.60 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
9 4” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300181 Sanderson 5.12 /ft SDR26PP Sanderson 3.80 /ft 47300181 Sanderson 3.72 /ft no bid /ft
10 4” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 6.13 /ft PYOBEPP20 Sanderson 6.50 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
11 6” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300207 Sanderson 10.81 /ft SDR26PU Diamond 8.19 /ft 47300207 Sanderson 7.82 /ft no bid /ft
12 8” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300223 Sanderson 17.81 /ft SDR26PX Diamond 13.85 /ft 47300223 Sanderson 13.67 /ft no bid /ft
13 2” x 11/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715-00 Continental 300.00 ea 516117071500 Continental 280.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
14 21/2” x 1 1/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+01 Continental 330.00 ea HT2291837212 Spears 320.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
15 3” x 11/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+02 Continental 380.00 ea 516119071500 Continental 350.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
16 4” x 1 1/4" PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+03 Continental 310.00 ea 516121071500 Continental 285.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
17 6" x 1 1/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+04 Continental 380.00 ea 516124071500 Continental 365.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
18 8" x 11/4" PVC Fact Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+05 Continental 540.00 ea HT2577837212 Spears 530.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
19 2" x 2" PVC Fast tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+06 Continental 340.00 ea 516117251700 Continental 325.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
20 21/2" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+07 Continental 200.00 ea HT291829020 Spears 185.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
21 3" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+08 Continental 360.00 ea 516119251700 Continental 345.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
22 4" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+09 Continental 450.00 ea 516121251700 Continental 425.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
23 6" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+10 Continental 560.00 ea 516124251700 Continental 535.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
24 8" x 2" pvc Fast Tap Saddle 5161-17-0715+11 Continental 580.00 ea HT2577829020 Spears 565.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
25 11/4" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-012 Spears 2.07 ea P40SCH Charlotte 1.40 ea 429-012 Spears 0.73 ea no bid ea
26 11/2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-015 Spears 2.20 ea P40SCJ Charlotte 1.50 ea 429-015 Spears 0.77 ea no bid ea
27 2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-020 Spears 3.37 ea P40SCK Charlotte 1.10 ea 429-020 Spears 1.19 ea no bid ea

28 2 1/2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-025 Spears 7.45 ea P40SCL Charlotte 4.00 ea 429-025 Spears 2.61 ea no bid ea
29 3" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-030 Spears 11.67 ea P40SCM Charlotte 3.80 ea 429-030 Spears 4.09 ea no bid ea
30 4" PVC GL Repair Coupling 109-040 Harco 83.17 ea 109.040 Harco 92.00 ea 109-040 Harco 58.70 ea no bid ea
31 6" PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-060 Harco 146.18 ea 109.060 Harco 150.00 ea 109-060 Harco 103.00 ea no bid ea
32 8" PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-080 Harco 301.10 ea 109.080 Harco 345.00 ea 109-080 Harco 212.54 ea no bid ea
33 11/4" Brass Swing Check Valve 9191L ASC 25.00 ea PFX31H Proflo 24.00 ea 15777 Matco 34.14 ea 246490 Lansdale 23.23 ea
34 11/2" Brass Swing Check Valve 9191L AsC 35.00 ea PFX31J Proflo 29.50 ea 15778 Matco 43.26 ea 552273 Lansdale 29.44 ea
35 2" Brass Swing Check Valve 9191L ASC 60.00 ea PFX31K Proflo 46.50 ea 15779 Matco 68.50 ea 272735 Lansdale 44.33 ea
36 2 1/2" Brass Swing Check Valve 9191L AsC 100.00 ea PFX31L Proflo 93.00 ea 18287 Matco 121.30 ea 049706 Lansdale 90.45 ea
37 11/4" Brass IPT Gate Valve 8501L ASC 32.00 ea PFXT300H Proflo 25.00 ea 15752 Matco 29.67 ea 016314 Lansdale 23.54 ea
38 11/2" Brass IPT Valve 8501L ASC 40.00 ea PFXT300) Proflo 34.00 ea 15755 Matco 35.51 ea 003849 Lansdale 27.45 ea
39 2" Brass IPT Gate Valve 8501L ASC 78.00 ea PFXT300K Proflo 50.00 ea 15758 Matco 49.90 ea 429562 Lansdale 38.56 ea
40 2 1/2” Brass IPT Gate Valve 8501L ASC 200.00 ea PFXT300L Proflo 120.00 ea 18069 Matco 98.01 ea 003869 Lansdale 278.64 ea
41 3” Brass IPT Gate Valve 8501L AsC 250.00 ea PFXT300M Proflo 125.00 ea 18070 Matco 150.07 ea 003875 Lansdale 111.65 ea
42 4” Brass IPT Gate Valve 8501L AsC 330.00 ea PFXT300P Proflo 226.00 ea 18071 Matco 212.63 ea 548956 Lansdale 164.49 ea
43 11/4"PVC Female Adapter 435-012 Spears 2.43 ea P40SFAH Charlotte 1.25 ea 435-012 Spears 0.86 ea no bid ea
44 11/4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 436-012 Spears 2.07 ea P40SMAH Charlotte 1.25 ea 436-012 Spears 0.73 ea no bid ea
45 11/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 436-015 Spears 2.77 ea P40SMAJ Charlotte 1.65 ea 436-015 Spears 0.97 ea no bid ea
46 2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 436-020 Spears 3.62 ea P40SMAK Charlotte 2.00 ea 436-020 Spears 1.27 ea no bid ea
a7 2 1/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 406-025 Spears 10.67 ea P40SMAL Charlotte 4.50 ea 436-025 Spears 3.74 ea no bid ea
48 3” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 436-030 Spears 15.63 ea P40SMAM Charlotte 7.80 ea 436-030 Spears 5.49 ea no bid ea
49 4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 436-040 Spears 19.97 ea P40SMAP Charlotte 8.60 ea 436-040 Spears 7.01 ea no bid ea
50 11/4” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-012 Spears 3.35 ea P40S9H Charlotte 1.50 ea 406-012 Spears 117 ea no bid ea
51 11/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-015 Spears 3.60 ea P4059) Charlotte 1.75 ea 406-015 Spears 1.27 ea no bid ea
52 2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-020 Spears 5.63 ea P40S9K Charlotte 2.30 ea 406-020 Spears 197 ea no bid ea
53 21/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-025 Spears 17.20 ea P40S9L Charlotte 6.75 ea 406-025 Spears 6.04 ea no bid ea
54 3” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-030 Spears 20.57 ea P40S9M Charlotte 7.50 ea 406-030 Spears 7.21 ea no bid ea
55 4” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-040 Spears 36.78 ea P40S9P Charlotte 14.00 ea 406-040 Spears 12.91 ea no bid ea



mailto:blavergne@winwaterworks.com
mailto:blavergne@winwaterworks.com
mailto:blavergne@winwaterworks.com
mailto:keith.dyson@ferguson.com
mailto:keith.dyson@ferguson.com
mailto:keith.dyson@ferguson.com
mailto:mself@coburns.com
mailto:mself@coburns.com
mailto:mself@coburns.com
mailto:shane.carson@coreandmain.com
mailto:shane.carson@coreandmain.com
mailto:shane.carson@coreandmain.com
mailto:blavergne@winwaterworks.com
mailto:keith.dyson@ferguson.com
mailto:mself@coburns.com
mailto:shane.carson@coreandmain.com

56 11/4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-012 Spears 4.05 ea P40S4H Charlotte 1.75 ea 417-012 Spears 141 ea no bid ea
57 11/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-015 Spears 5.05 ea P4054) Charlotte 2.00 ea 417-015 Spears 1.77 ea no bid ea
58 2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-020 Spears 6.62 ea P40S4K Charlotte 2.55 ea 417-020 Spears 2.33 ea no bid ea
59 2 1/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-025 Spears 17.23 ea P40S4L Charlotte 6.50 ea 417-025 Spears 6.06 ea no bid ea
60 3” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-030 Spears 26.73 ea P40S4M Charlotte 9.50 ea 417-030 Spears 9.39 ea no bid ea
61 4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-040 Spears 47.93 ea P40S4P Charlotte 18.00 ea 417-040 Spears 16.83 ea no bid ea
62 11/4” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW 475-012 Spears 13.65 ea P40SYH Spears 5.55 ea 475-012 Spears 4.79 ea no bid ea
63 11/2” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW 475-015 Spears 17.53 ea P40SYJ Spears 6.50 ea 475-015 Spears 6.16 ea no bid ea
64 2” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW 475-020 Spears 52.58 ea P40SYK Spears 22.00 ea 475-020 Spears 18.56 ea no bid ea
65 2 1/2” WYE SCH 40 SW 475-025 Spears 120.18 ea P40SYL Spears 44.00 ea 475-025 Spears 42.19 ea no bid ea
66 3” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW 475-030 Spears 88.57 ea P40SYM Spears 37.00 ea 475-030 Spears 31.09 ea no bid ea
67 4” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW 475-040 Spears 167.05 ea P40SYP Spears 70.00 ea 475-040 Spears 58.63 ea no bid ea
68 11/4” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-012 Spears 3.92 ea P40STH Charlotte 1.80 ea 401-012 Spears 1.37 ea no bid ea
69 11/2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-015 Spears 4.78 ea P40ST) Charlotte 2.40 ea 401-015 Spears 1.67 ea no bid ea
70 2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-020 Spears 6.97 ea P40STK Charlotte 2.75 ea 401-020 Spears 2.44 ea no bid ea
71 2 1/2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-025 Spears 22.97 ea P40STL Charlotte 11.00 ea 401-025 Spears 8.06 ea no bid ea
72 3” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-030 Spears 30.18 ea P40STM Charlotte 13.00 ea 401-030 Spears 10.60 ea no bid ea
73 4” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW 401-040 Spears 54.62 ea P40STP Charlotte 21.00 ea 401-040 Spears 19.17 ea no bid ea
74 6” MJ TEE 101291 Tyler Union 162.53 ea MJTLAU Tyler 190.00 ea DMT66 SIGMA 205.93 ea no bid ea
75 8” MJ TEE 101413 Tyler Union 242.55 ea MITLAX Tyler 290.00 ea DMT88 SIGMA 308.23 ea no bid ea
76 2” X '11/4” PVC SW Reducer 429-250 Spears 10.30 ea P40SBKH Charlotte 3.50 ea 429-250 Spears 3.61 ea no bid ea
77 2” x11/2” PVC SW Reducer 429-251 Spears 7.53 ea P40SBK) Charlotte 2.95 ea 429-251 Spears 2.64 ea no bid ea
78 21/2” x 2” SW Reducer 429-292 Spears 15.52 ea P40SBLK Charlotte 6.00 ea 429-292 Spears 5.44 ea no bid ea
79 3”x11/4” PVC SW Reducer 429-336 Spears 54.93 ea P40SBMH Charlotte 17.25 ea no bid ea no bid ea
80 3” x11/2 SW PVC Reducer 429-337 Spears 45.63 ea P40SBMJ Charlotte 17.25 ea 429-337 Spears 16.01 ea no bid ea
81 3” x 2" PVC SW Reducer 429-338 Spears 40.50 ea P40SBMK Charlotte 15.00 ea 429-338 Spears 14.21 ea no bid ea
82 3” x21/2” PVC SW Reducer 429-339 Spears 34.37 ea P40SBML Charlotte 13.00 ea 429-339 Spears 12.06 ea no bid ea
83 4” x 1 1/4” PVC SW Reducer 429-418 Spears 86.90 ea P40SBPH Charlotte 20.50 ea no bid ea no bid ea
84 4” x11/2” PVC SW Reducer 429-419 Spears 69.67 ea P40SBP) Charlotte 25.00 ea 429-419 Spears 24.46 ea no bid ea
85 4” x 2” PVC SW Reducer 429-420 Spears 49.03 ea P40SBPK Charlotte 18.00 ea 429-420 Spears 17.21 ea no bid ea
86 4” x21/2” PVC SW Reducer 429-421 Spears 61.82 ea P40SBPL Charlotte 23.00 ea 429-421 Spears 21.70 ea no bid ea
87 6" x 2” PVC SW Reducer 429-528F Spears 148.23 ea P40SBUK Charlotte 59.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
88 6” x 3” PVC SW Reducer 429-530F Spears 129.97 ea P40SBUM Charlotte 59.00 ea 429-530F Spears 111.40 ea no bid ea
89 6” x4” PVC SW Reducer 429-532 Spears 66.80 ea P40SBUP Charlotte 33.00 ea 429-532 Spears 23.44 ea no bid ea
90 8” x 2" PVC SW Reducer 429-578F Spears 329.97 ea P40SBXK Charlotte 120.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
91 8” x 4” PVC SW Reducer 429-582 Spears 154.85 ea P40SBXP Charlotte 103.00 ea 429-582 Spears 54.36 ea no bid ea
92 11/4” PVC Compression Coupling 110-012 Matco 12.80 ea JC12125 Charlotte 12.00 ea $110-12 Spears 14.70 ea no bid ea
93 11/2” PVC Compression Coupling 110-015 Matco 13.50 ea Jc12 Charlotte 9.00 ea 5110-15 Spears 15.16 ea no bid ea
94 2" PVC Compression Coupling 110-020 Matco 17.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 9.00 ea $110-20 Spears 19.70 ea no bid ea
95 2 1/2” PVC Compression Coupling 110-025 Matco 32.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 33.00 ea 5110-25 Spears 37.06 ea no bid ea
96 3” PVC Compression Coupling 110-030 Matco 39.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 37.00 ea $110-30 Spears 48.53 ea no bid ea
97 4” PVC Compression Coupling 110-040 Matco 55.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 49.00 ea $110-40 Spears 79.81 ea no bid ea
98 6" PVC Compression Coupling 110-060 Matco 80.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 76.00 ea $110-60 Spears 181.51 ea no bid ea
99 8" PVC Compression Coupling 110-080 Matco 115.00 ea Jc12 Charlotte 99.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
100 11/4” PVC SW Cap 447-012 Spears 2.20 ea P40SCAPH Charlotte 1.40 ea 447-012 Spears 0.77 ea no bid ea
101 11/2” PVC SW Cap 447-015 Spears 2.43 ea P40SCAP) Charlotte 1.40 ea 447-015 Spears 0.86 ea no bid ea
102 2" PVC SW Cap 447-020 Spears 2.90 ea P40SCAPK Charlotte 1.55 ea 447-020 Spears 1.01 ea no bid ea
103 21/2” PVC SW Cap 447-025 Spears 9.25 ea P40SCAPL Charlotte 4.50 ea 447-025 Spears 3.24 ea no bid ea
104 3” PVC SW Cap 447-030 Spears 10.10 ea P40SCAPM Charlotte 4.70 ea 447-030 Spears 3.54 ea no bid ea
105 4” PVC SW Cap 447-040 Spears 22.97 ea P40SCAPP Charlotte 9.00 ea 447-040 Spears 8.06 ea no bid ea
106 6" PVC SW Cap 447-060 Spears 55.10 ea P40SCAPU Charlotte 21.00 ea 447-060 Spears 19.34 ea no bid ea
107 8" PVC SW Cap 447-080 Spears 138.40 ea P40SCAPX Charlotte 52.00 ea 447-080 Spears 48.57 ea no bid ea
108 11/2” PVC GJ Cap 149-015 Harco 32.33 ea PPRGCAPJ Harco 25.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
109 2” PVC GJ Cap 149-020 Harco 35.80 ea PPRGCAPK Harco 29.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
110 21/2” PVC GJ Cap 149-025 Harco 55.53 ea PPRGCAPL Harco 43.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
111 3” PVC GJ Cap 149-030 Harco 59.50 ea PPRGCAPM Harco 47.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
112 4” PVC GJ Cap 149-040 Harco 122.50 ea PPRGCAPP Harco 76.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
113 6" PVC GJ Cap 149-060 Harco 279.13 ea PPRGCAPU Harco 175.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
114 8" PVC GJ Cap 149-080 Harco 500.00 ea PPRGCAPX Harco 510.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
115 11/4” IPT Galvanized Cap IGCAPH Matco 6.00 ea IGCAPH Matco 6.50 ea 11209 Matco 3.11 ea 003417 Lansdale 3.15 ea
116 11/2” IPT Galvanized Cap IGCAP) Matco 6.85 ea IGCAP) Matco 7.25 ea 11868 Matco 3.97 ea 003463 Lansdale 3.75 ea




117 20' Float with Weights 1006053 Delta 240.00 ea 1006053 Delta 255.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
118 30' Float with Weights 106053 Delta 295.00 ea 1006053 Delta 325.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
119 1 1/4" Galvenized Steel Nipple no bid ea IGNHK Matco 6.50 ea no bid ea 003421 Lansdale 2.87 ea
120 1/2" PVC SCH 40 90 ELL 406-005 Spears 0.93 ea no bid ea 406-005 Spears 33 ea no bid ea
121 1/2" PVC SCH 40 45 ELL 417-005 Spears 1.57 ea no bid ea 417-005 Spears .54 ea no bid ea
122 1/2" PVC SCH 40 Coupling 429-005 Spears 0.62 ea no bid ea 429-005 Spears .21 ea no bid ea
123 1/2" PVC SCH 40 Female 435-005 Spears 1.33 ea no bid ea 435-005 Spears 37 ea no bid ea
124 1/2" PVC SCH 40 Male 436-005 Spears 0.85 ea no bid ea 436-005 Spears .30 ea no bid ea
125 1/2" PVC SCH 40 Tee 401-005 Spears 1.17 ea no bid ea 401-005 Spears 41 ea no bid ea
126 6" SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 11.50 ea PYOBEPU20! Charlotte 5.75 ft no bid ea no bid ea
127 8" SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 18.00 ea PYOBEPX20 Charlotte 9.00 ft no bid ea no bid ea
%DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE %DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE %DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LISTPRICE | %DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LISTPRICE |
CATEGORY # |CATEGORIES FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT* FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT* FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT* FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT*
1 SCH 40 PVS FITTINGS 30% 25% No Bid No Bid
2 SCH 80 PVC FITTINGS 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 BRASS FITTINGS 10% 10% No Bid No Bid
4 METERS 0% 10% No Bid No Bid
5 SERVICE TUBING 10% 25% No Bid No Bid
6 PIPE 0% 0% No Bid No Bid
7 MECHANICAL JOINT FITTINGS 10% 10% No Bid No Bid
8 VALVES 10% 10% No Bid No Bid
9 OTHER 0% 0% No Bid No Bid
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