
Bid Title: Distribution Pipe & Fittings 
Bid Number: SB-2024-PW-126 Final

Effective: July 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024
Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works

Item # Description Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM
1 2” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle 4168-000 AY McDonald 28.77 ea FS70203 FORD 26.68 ea S70-203 Ford 28.38 ea S70-203 Ford 26.44 ea
2 2” x 1” CC Brass Saddle 4168-002 AY McDonald 28.77 ea FS70204 FORD 26.68 ea S70-204 Ford 28.38 ea S70-204 Ford 26.44 ea
3 4” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle 4168-012 AY McDonald 40.73 ea FS70403 FORD 40.80 ea S70-403 Ford 44.05 ea S70-403 Ford 40.58 ea
4 4” x 1” CC Brass Saddle 4168-014 AY McDonald 40.73 ea FS70404 FORD 40.80 ea S70-404 Ford 44.05 ea S70-404 Ford 40.58 ea
5 4” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-017 AY McDonald 87.67 ea FS71406 FORD 87.30 ea S71-406 Ford 94.89 ea S71-406 Ford 86.46 ea
6 4” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle 4168-016 AY McDonald 87.67 ea FS70406 FORD 87.30 ea S70-406 Ford 94.89 ea S70-406 Ford 86.46 ea
7 4” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-019 AY McDonald 87.67 ea FS71407 FORD 87.30 ea S71-407 Ford 94.89 ea S71-407 Ford 86.46 ea
8 6” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle 4168-020 AY McDonald 60.74 ea FS70603 FORD 60.50 ea S70-603 Ford 65.73 ea S70-603 Ford 60.56 ea
9 6” x 1” CC Brass Saddle 4168-022 AY McDonald 60.71 ea FS70604 FORD 60.50 ea S70-604 Ford 65.73 ea S70-604 Ford 60.56 ea

10 6” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-025 AY McDonald 114.60 ea FS71606 FORD 113.65 ea S71-606 Ford 124.02 ea S71-606 Ford 113.00 ea
11 6” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle 4168-024 AY McDonald 114.60 ea FS70606 FORD 113.65 ea S70-606 Ford 124.02 ea S70-606 Ford 113.00 ea
12 6” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-027 AY McDonald 114.60 ea FS71607 FORD 113.65 ea S71-607 Ford 124.02 ea S71-607 Ford 113.00 ea
13 8” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle 4168-028 AY McDonald 91.70 ea FS70803 FORD 82.40 ea S70-803 Ford 90.33 ea S70-803 Ford 83.22 ea
14 8” x 1” CC Brass Saddle 4168-030 AY McDonald 91.70 ea FS70804 FORD 82.40 ea S70-804 Ford 90.33 ea S70-804 Ford 83.22 ea
15 8” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-033 AY McDonald 118.19 ea FS71806 FORD 116.45 ea S71-806 Ford 127.88 ea S71-806 Ford 116.51 ea
16 8” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle 4168-032 AY McDonald 118.19 ea FS70806 FORD 116.45 ea S70-806 Ford 127.88 ea S70-806 Ford 116.51 ea
17 8” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle 4168-035 AY McDonald 118.19 ea FS71807 FORD 116.45 ea S71-807 Ford 127.88 ea S71-807 Ford 116.51 ea
18 12” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle 4128-026 AY McDonald 214.24 ea FS701203 FORD 213.00 ea S70-1203 Ford 231.85 ea S70-1203 Ford 211.24 ea
19 12” x 1” CC Brass Saddle 4128-025 AY McDonald 214.24 ea FS701204 FORD 213.00 ea S70-1204 Ford 231.85 ea S70-1204 Ford 211.24 ea
20 12” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle 4128-038 AY McDonald 247.49 ea FS711206 FORD 245.90 ea S71-S91-1206 Ford 267.85 ea S90-S71-1206 Ford 241.36 ea
21 12” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle 4128-037 AY McDonald 247.49 ea FS701206 FORD 245.90 ea S70-S90-1206 Ford 267.85 ea S90-S70-1206 Ford 241.36 ea
22 12” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle 4128-040 AY McDonald 247.49 ea FS711207 FORD 245.90 ea S71-S91-1207 Ford 267.85 ea S91-S71-1207 Ford 241.36 ea
23 2” (2.35-2.63) F.C. Clamp x 12” ### Smith-Blair 79.36 ea FS1263125 FORD 76.40 ea FS1-263-125 Ford 84.82 ea FS1-263-125 Ford 79.03 ea
24 4” (4.45-4.73) F.C. Clamp x 12” ### Smith-Blair 98.52 ea FS1473125 FORD 83.50 ea FS1-473-125 Ford 92.81 ea FS1-473-125 Ford 86.49 ea
25 6” (6.56-6.96) F.C. Clamp x 12” ### Smith-Blair 112.38 ea FS1696125 FORD 112.50 ea FS1-696-125 Ford 125.27 ea FS1-696-125 Ford 115.42 ea
26 8” (8.54-8.94) F.C. Clamp x 12” ### Smith-Blair 132.51 ea FS1894125 FORD 127.00 ea FS1-894-125 FORD 140.40 ea FS1-894-125 FORD 130.83 ea
27 12” (12.62-13.02) F.C. Clamp x 12” ### Smith-Blair 227.50 ea FS1302125 FORD 171.00 ea FS1-1302-125 FORD 190.93 ea FS1-1302-125 FORD 173.62 ea
28 2” PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-020 Harco 22.92 ea PPRG109020 Harco 29.00 ea 109-020 Harco 24.59 ea no bid ea
29 4” PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-040 Harco 56.70 ea PPRG109040 Harco 69.00 ea 109-040 Harco 58.70 ea no bid ea
30 6” PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-060 Harco 99.67 ea PPRG109060 Harco 120.00 ea 109-060 Harco 103.00 ea no bid ea
31 8” PVC GJ Repair Coupling 109-080 Harco 205.30 ea PPRG109080 Harco 255.00 ea 109-080 Harco 212.54 ea no bid ea
32 2” MJ Repair Coupling 507376.00 Tyler Union 71.09 ea MJLSLAK Tyler 185.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
33 4” MJ Repair Coupling 137375.00 Tyler Union 61.16 ea MJLSLAP Tyler 194.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
34 6” MJ Repair Coupling 137399.00 Tyler Union 102.45 ea MJLSLAU Tyler 268.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
35 8” MJ Repair Coupling 137412.00 Tyler Union 164.66 ea MJLSLAX Tyler 306.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
36 12” MJ Repair Coupling 137313.00 Tyler Union 197.07 ea MJLSLA12 Tyler 422.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
37 3/4” CTS Brass Compression Coupling 015403 250N Mueller 22.94 ea C4433NLQ FORD 23.40 ea C44-33-Q-NL FORD 25.04 ea C44-33QNL FORD 23.33 ea
38 1” CTS Brass Compression Coupling 015403 330N Mueller 25.03 ea C4444NLQ FORD 26.50 ea C44-44-Q-NL FORD 28.65 ea C44-44QNL FORD 26.69 ea
39 1 1/2” CTS Brass Compression Coupling 015403 500N Mueller 88.27 ea C4466NLQ FORD 87.00 ea C44-66-Q-NL FORD 95.85 ea C44-66QNL FORD 87.33 ea
40 2” CTS Brass Compression Coupling 015403 550N Mueller 120.41 ea C4477NLQ FORD 120.00 ea C44-77-Q-NL FORD 129.39 ea C44-77QNL FORD 119.21 ea
41 2” IPS Brass Compression Coupling 5132-193 AY McDonald 176.61 /ft C7777NLQ FORD 170.30 /ft C77-77-NL FORD 183.26 /ft C77-77NL FORD 166.97 /ft
42 3/4” IPS PVC Compression Coupling 110-34 Matco 9.50 /ft JC12075 Jones 6.50 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
43 1” IPS PVC Compression Coupling 110-10 Matco 12.00 /ft JC12100 Jones 9.00 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
44 1 1/2” IPS PVC Compression Coupling 110-15 Matco 18.50 /ft JC12150 Jones 14.00 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
45 2” IPS PVC Compression Coupling 110-20 Matco 22.80 /ft JC12200 Jones 15.50 /ft no bid /ft no bid /ft
46 3/4” SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 0.70 /ft PY0BEPF20 Sanderson 0.75 /ft 03926 JM Eagle 0.36 /ft no bid /ft
47 1” SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 1.08 /ft PY0BEPG20 Sanderson 1.60 /ft 03929 JM Eagle 0.56 /ft no bid /ft
48 1 1/2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 1.72 /ft PY0BEPJ20 Sanderson 2.40 /ft 03931 JM Eagle 0.87 /ft no bid /ft
49 2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe ASTM D 1785 Charlotte 2.22 /ft BY0BEPK20 Sanderson 2.70 /ft 03932 JM Eagle 1.14 /ft no bid /ft
50 2” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300124.00 Sanderson 1.59 /ft SDR26PK  (200) Sanderson 1.40 /ft 47300124 Diamond 1.40 /ft no bid /ft
51 4” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300181.00 Sanderson 5.12 /ft SDR26PP Sanderson 3.66 /ft 47300181 Diamond 3.72 /ft no bid /ft
52 6” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300207.00 Sanderson 10.81 /ft SDR26PU Diamond 7.83 /ft 47300207 Diamond 7.82 /ft no bid /ft
53 8” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300223.00 Sanderson 17.81 /ft SDR26PX Diamond 13.34 /ft 47300223 Diamond 13.67 /ft no bid /ft
54 12” PVCGJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 47300228.00 Sanderson 39.49 /ft SDR26P12 Diamond 29.03 /ft 47300228 Diamond 29.76 /ft no bid /ft
55 12” GJ PVC C900 Pipe Class 150 SDR 18 47305081.00 Sanderson 50.25 /ft DR18BP12 Diamond 44.73 /ft 47305081 Diamond 45.46 /ft no bid /ft
56 3/4” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X475250500B ADS 0.35 /ft PEC9AF500 ADS 0.39 /ft X475250500B ADS 0.33 /ft no bid /ft
57 1” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X412505500B ADS 0.58 /ft PEC9AG300 ADS 0.63 /ft X412505500B ADS 0.53 /ft no bid /ft
58 1" IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X71200500OD ADS 0.76 /ft PEI11AG300 ADS 0.95 /ft X71200500OD ADS 0.85 /ft no bid /ft
59 1 1/2” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X4150250100B ADS 1.20 /ft PEG9AJ100 ADS 1.33 /ft X4150250100B ADS 1.11 /ft no bid /ft
60 1 1/2” IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X7150200500OD ADS 1.80 /ft PEIHAJ500 ADS 1.76 /ft X7150200500OD ADS 1.56 /ft no bid /ft
61 2” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X42250500B ADS 2.06 /ft PEC9AK100 ADS 2.28 /ft X42250500B ADS 1.90 /ft no bid /ft
62 2” IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X72200500OD ADS 3.05 /ft PEI11K500 ADS 2.50 /ft X72200500OD United 1.81 /ft no bid /ft
63 4” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PI0411 IMSCO 4.87 /ft PEI11AP40 UPS,JM 4.20 /ft 46149515 JM Eagle 4.60 /ft no bid /ft
64 4” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PD0411BS IMSCO 6.36 /ft PED11AP40 UPS,JM 6.95 /ft 46174300 JM Eagle 5.23 /ft no bid /ft

Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Waterworks Coburns Supply Core & Main LP
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

337-269-0032 337-625-3300 337-474-0526 225-756-4122
Bryan Lavergne Brad Johnson Mark Tate Shane Carson
337-269-1130 F 337-474-0987 F 337-474-0987 (F) 225-756-4144 (F)

blavergne@winwaterworks.com keith.dyson@ferguson.com mtate@coburns.com shane.carson@coreandmain.com
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65 6” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PI0611 IMSCO 8.91 /ft PEI11AU40 UPS,JM 8.75 /ft 46149500 JM Eagle 8.73 /ft no bid /ft
66 6” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PD0611BS IMSCO 11.39 ea PED11AU40 UPS,JM 9.95 ea 46174302 JM Eagle 9.44 ea no bid ea
67 8” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PI0811 IMSCO 14.95 ea PEI11AX40 UPS,JM 12.53 ea 46149520 JM Eagle 15.06 ea no bid ea
68 8” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PD0811BS IMSCO 18.21 ea PED11AX40 UPS,JM 13.20 ea 46174304 JM Eagle 16.50 ea no bid ea
69 12” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PI1211 IMSCO 34.64 ea PEI11A1240 UPS,JM 35.80 ea 60900012 JM Eagle 32.54 ea no bid ea
70 12” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PD1211BS IMSCO 36.47 ea PED11A1240 UPS,JM 28.40 ea 46174308 JM Eagle 41.18 ea no bid ea

71 2” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2502MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 520.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea

72 4” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2504MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 835.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea

73 6” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2506MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 1025.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea

74 10” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2510MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 2465.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea

75 8” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2508MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 1685.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea

76 12” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL no bid ea AFC2512MMLAOL
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 3095.00 ea American Flow Control no bid ea American Flow Control no bid ea
77 2” IPT Gate Valve Mueller Mueller 460.00 ea AFC2602SSOL AFC 440.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
78 1 1/2” Brass Gate Valve 514T08 AY McDonald 80.00 ea PFXT300J Proflo 38.00 ea no bid ea 700-175-00260 Lansdale 28.13 ea
79 2” Brass Gate Valve 514T08 AY McDonald 88.00 ea PFXT300K Proflo 52.00 ea no bid ea 700-175-00270 Lansdale 39.53 ea
80 1 1/2 “ Brass Ball Valve M100 AY McDonald 78.00 ea FNWX410CJ Proflo 52.00 ea NLVB206FP-24 MERIT BRASS 32.86 ea 700-260-00235 Lansdale 37.81 ea
81 3/4" x 3/4" 1"x1" Brass Tees ASC 31.00 ea IBRLFTG Merit no bid ea BRTFFG MERIT BRASS 13.35 ea no bid ea
82 3/4" Brass Tees ASC 7.90 ea IBRLFTF Merit 5.70 ea BRTF MERRIT BRASS 5.55 ea no bid ea
83 2” Brass Ball Valve 514T08 AY McDonald 94.50 ea FNWX41OCK Proflo 75.00 ea NLVB206FP-32 FORD 55.51 ea 700-200-00240 Lansdale 53.69 ea
84 3/4” Curb Stop MTR Nut x Comp 5182-068 AY McDonald 93.23 ea B43232WNLQ Ford 70.00 ea B43-344W-Q-NL FORD 113.74 ea B43-344WQNL FORD 103.63 ea
85 1” Curb Stop MTR Nut x CTS Comp 5182-222 AY McDonald 137.76 ea B43344WNLQ Ford 127.95 ea B43-444W-Q-NL FORD 139.82 ea B43-344WQNL FORD 127.39 ea
86 1 1/2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x CTS Comp 5182-134 AY McDonald 246.33 ea BF43666WNLQ Ford 229.25 ea BF43-666W-Q-NL FORD 249.99 ea BF43-666WQNL FORD 230.33 ea
87 2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x CTS Comp 5182-205 AY McDonald 417.32 ea BF43777WNLQ Ford 384.30 ea BF43-777W-Q-NL FORD 423.45 ea BF43-777WQNL FORD 390.15 ea
88 2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x IPS Comp 5149-023 AY McDonald 440.24 ea BF73777WNLQ Ford 415.00 ea BF63-777W-IDR7-NL FORD 456.06 ea BF63-777WIDR7NL FORD 415.52 ea
89 3/4” Corp Stop CC x CTS Comp 025008 250N Mueller 60.74 ea F10003NLQ Ford 42.50 ea F1000-3-Q-NL FORD 44.85 ea F1000-3QNL FORD 41.33 ea
90 1” Corp Stop CC x CTS Comp 025008 330N Mueller 79.91 ea F10004NLQ Ford 61.75 ea F1000-4-Q-NL FORD 67.83 ea F1000-4QNL FORD 63.20 ea
91 1 1/2” Corp Stop IPT x Comp 025008 500N Mueller 180.33 ea FB110066NLQ Ford 178.60 ea FB1100-6-Q-NL FORD 195.55 ea FB11006QNL FORD 178.17 ea
92 2” Corp Stop IPT x Comp 025008 550N Mueller 298.22 ea FB110077NLQ Ford 297.50 ea FB1100-7-Q-NL FORD 323.45 ea FB11007QNL FORD 294.70 ea
93 3/4” Brass Meter Coupling 014201 215N Mueller 38.42 ea M74620F Matco 8.50 ea C38-23-2-25-NL FORD 13.35 ea 014201215N Mueller 38.42 ea
94 1” Brass Meter Coupling 014202 330N Mueller 38.22 ea M74620G Matco 13.50 ea C38-44-2-265-NL FORD 20.56 ea 014201330N Mueller 38.22 ea
95 1" CTS x IPS Brass Adapter 015409 330N Mueller 66.14 ea C4744N Ford 55.00 ea no bid ea 015409330N Mueller 66.14 ea
96 1 1/2" CTS x IPS Brass Adapter 5125-159 AY McDonald 129.98 ea C4766NL Ford 148.00 ea C84-66-Q-NL FORD 66.71 ea no bid ea
97 2" CTS x IPS Brass Adapter 5182-410 AY McDonald 151.72 ea C4777NL Ford 201.00 ea C84-77-Q-NL FORD 97.20 ea no bid ea
98 1 1/2” Brass Male Adapter MIP x CTS Comp 015428 500N Mueller 62.84 ea C8466NL Ford 60.50 ea no bid ea 015428500N Mueller 62.13 ea
99 2” Brass Adapter MIP x CTS Comp 015428 550N Mueller 91.57 ea C8477NL Ford 88.00 ea no bid ea C84-66QNL FORD 62.16 ea

100 2” Brass Adapter MIP x IPS Comp 5132-191 AY McDonald 119.66 ea C8777NL Ford 111.00 ea no bid ea C84-77QNL FORD 88.56 ea
101 1 1/2” Brass Female Adapter FIP x CTS Comp 015451 500N Mueller 80.36 ea C1466NL Ford 78.40 ea C14-66-Q-NL FORD 85.32 ea C87-77NL FORD 110.64 ea
102 2” Female Adapter FIP x CTS Comp 015451 550N Mueller 95.76 ea C1477NL Ford 95.00 ea C14-77-Q-NL FORD 101.60 ea C14-66QNL FORD 77.73 ea
103 2” Female Adapter FIP x IPS Comp 5132-192 AY McDonald 137.52 ea C1777NL Ford 128.70 ea no bid ea C14-77QNL FORD 92.57 ea
104 1” x 2” Brass Nipple 86NI4010020C ASC 9.00 ea GBRNGK Merit 4.50 ea BRNGK MERIT BRASS 4.79 ea 550-200-00750 Lansdale 8.25 ea
105 1 1/2” x 2” Brass Nipple 86NI4010020C ASC 14.50 ea GBRNJK Merit 8.50 ea BRNJK MERIT BRASS 8.06 ea 550-200-01040 Lansdale 11.66 ea
106 2” x 2” Brass Nipple 86NI4010020C ASC 18.50 ea GBRNKCL Merit 12.25 ea BRNKC MERIT BRASS 11.40 ea 550-200-01160 Lansdale 11.66 ea
107 3" x 1 1/4" Brass Nipple 86NI4010020C ASC 50.00 ea GBRNHM Merit 9.25 ea BRNHM MERIT BRASS 10.00 ea 550-200-00920 Lansdale 9.00 ea
108 1 1/2” CI Meter Flange Kit 4031-001 AY McDonald 27.47 ea M432T07P Matconorca 36.00 ea 16891 Matco 40.16 ea 200-225-00820 Lansdale 26.27 ea
109 2” CI Meter Flange Kit 4031-002 AY McDonald 30.75 ea M432T08P Matconorca 40.00 ea 16890 Matco 45.77 ea 200-225-00830 Lansdale 33.57 ea
110 3/4” Dual Check Valve MTR Nut x FIP 5122-096 AY McDonald 46.89 ea MH14242NEFF Mueller 61.20 ea 15718 Matco 7.10 ea HHS31-323NL FORD 81.93 ea
111 1” Dual Check Valve MTR Nut x FIP 5123-064 AY McDonald 51.40 ea MH14242 Mueller 109.00 ea 15719 Matco 10.14 ea HHS31-444NL FORD 151.17 ea
112 1 1/2” Dual Check Valve MTR FLG x FIP 5183-284 AY McDonald 305.34 ea FHFS31666NL Ford 233.50 ea no bid ea HFS31-666NL FORD 216.46 ea
113 2” Dual Check Valve MTR FLG x FIP 5183-286 AY McDonald 370.27 ea FHS31777NL Ford 267.00 ea no bid ea HFS31-777-NL FORD 262.49 ea
114 3/4” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-007 Spears 1.05 ea P40S9F Charlotte 0.75 ea 406-007 SPEARS 0.37 ea no bid ea
115 1” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-010 Spears 1.90 ea P40S9G Charlotte 1.00 ea 406-010 SPEARS 0.67 ea no bid ea
116 1 1/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-015 Spears 3.60 ea P40S9J Charlotte 1.75 ea 406-015 SPEARS 1.27 ea no bid ea
117 2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW 406-020 Spears 5.63 ea P40S9K Charlotte 2.30 ea 406-020 SPEARS 1.97 ea no bid ea
118 3/4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-007 Spears 2.43 ea P40S4F Charlotte 1.40 ea 417-007 SPEARS 0.86 ea no bid ea
119 1 1/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-015 Spears 5.05 ea P40S4J Charlotte 2.00 ea 417-015 SPEARS 1.77 ea no bid ea
120 2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW 417-020 Spears 6.62 ea P40S4K Charlotte 2.55 ea 417-020 SPEARS 2.33 ea no bid ea
121 3/4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW 436-007 Spears 0.93 ea P40SMAF Charlotte 0.50 ea 436-007 SPEARS 0.33 ea no bid ea
122 1” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW 436-010 Spears 1.68 ea P40SMAG Charlotte 1.20 ea 436-010 SPEARS 0.59 ea no bid ea
123 1 1/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW 436-015 Spears 2.77 ea P40SMAJ Charlotte 1.65 ea 436-015 SPEARS 0.97 ea no bid ea
124 2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW 436-020 Spears 3.62 ea P40SMAK Charlotte 2.00 ea 436-020 SPEARS 1.27 ea no bid ea
125 3/4” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW 435-007 Spears 1.33 ea P40SFAF Charlotte 0.76 ea 435-007 SPEARS 0.47 ea no bid ea
126 1” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW 435-010 Spears 1.57 ea P40SFAG Charlotte 0.90 ea 435-010 SPEARS 0.54 ea no bid ea
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Bryan Lavergne Brad Johnson Mark Tate Shane Carson
337-269-1130 F 337-474-0987 F 337-474-0987 (F) 225-756-4144 (F)
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127 1 1/2” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW 435-015 Spears 2.77 ea P40SFAJ Charlotte 1.95 ea 435-015 SPEARS 0.97 ea no bid ea
128 2” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW 435-020 Spears 3.70 ea P40SFAK Charlotte 2.00 ea 435-020 SPEARS 1.30 ea no bid ea
129 3/4” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-007 Spears 0.85 ea P40SCF Charlotte 0.50 ea 429-007 SPEARS 0.30 ea no bid ea
130 1” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-010 Spears 1.48 ea P40SCG Charlotte 0.90 ea 429-010 SPEARS 0.53 ea no bid ea
131 1 1/2” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-015 Spears 4.78 ea P40SCJ Charlotte 1.50 ea 429-015 SPEARS 0.77 ea no bid ea
132 2” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW 429-020 Spears 6.97 ea P40SCK Charlotte 2.00 ea 429-020 SPEARS 1.19 ea no bid ea
133 3/4” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-007 Spears 0.98 ea P40SCAPF Charlotte 0.60 ea 447-007 SPEARS 0.77 ea no bid ea
134 1” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-010 Spears 1.57 ea P40SCAPG Charlotte 0.90 ea 447-010 SPEARS 0.54 ea no bid ea
135 1 1/2” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-015 Spears 2.43 ea P40SCAPJ Charlotte 1.40 ea 447-015 SPEARS 0.86 ea no bid ea
136 2” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-020 Spears 2.90 ea P40SCAPK Charlotte 1.55 ea 447-020 SPEARS 1.01 ea no bid ea
137 4” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-040 Spears 22.97 ea P40SCAPP Charlotte 9.00 ea 447-040 SPEARS 8.06 ea no bid ea
138 6” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW 447-060 Spears 55.10 ea P40SCAPU Charlotte 25.00 ea 447-060 SPEARS 19.34 ea no bid ea
139 8” PVS Cap SCH 40 SW 447-080 Spears 138.40 ea P40SCAPX Charlotte 52.00 ea 447-080 SPEARS 48.57 ea no bid ea
140 12” PVC Cap SCH 40SW 447-120F Spears 504.25 ea P40SCAP12 Charlotte 455.00 ea 447-120F SPEARS 432.21 ea no bid ea
141 2” Flush Hydrant K77 Kupferle 955.00 ea K77  (3') Kupferle 930.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
142 2-way Hydrant 3’ 6” Bury 425-524573 Mueller 2807.06 ea A425LA36 Mueller 2795.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 425-524573 Mueller 2720.21 ea
143 3-way Hydrant 3’ 6” Bury 423-523893 Mueller 2924.52 ea A423LA36 Mueller 2900.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 423-523893 Mueller 2823.58 ea
144 2 1/2” Hydrant Nozzle Wrench 143129 Mueller 174.15 ea 143129  (A316) Mueller 253.00 ea no bid ea 143129 Mueller 186.89 ea
145 4 1/2” Nozzle Wrench 143131 Mueller 189.02 ea 143131 Mueller 270.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 143131 Mueller 202.85 ea
146 2 1/2” Hose Nozzle 143116-75298 Mueller 107.95 ea 14311675298(A18) Mueller 253.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 143116-75298 Mueller 121.79 ea
147 4 1/2” Hose Nozzle 143124-40560 Mueller 346.94 ea 14312440560 Mueller 495.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 143124-40560 Mueller 359.19 ea
148 2 1/2” Hose Nozzle Cap 158661-75298 Mueller 111.57 ea 15866175298 Mueller 220.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 158661-75298 Mueller 125.87 ea
149 4 1/2” Hose Nozzle Cap 158668-40560 Mueller 261.86 ea 15866840560 Mueller 330.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 158668-40560 Mueller 272.17 ea
150 Hydrant Wrench 174510 Mueller 51.25 ea 41002  (ADJ) Raptor 86.00 ea 377-5960 Trumbull 25.28 ea 174510A-311 Mueller 68.14 ea
151 Hydrant Safety Flange Kit A301 Mueller 356.84 ea A301 Mueller 450.00 ea no bid ea A301 Mueller 356.84 ea
152 Hydrant Oil (10oz.) 280354 Mueller 30.59 ea 280354 Mueller 54.00 ea Mueller no bid ea 280354 Mueller 36.92 ea
153 Cast Iron Meter Box Lids THL SMB 70.00 ea 5834THOL SMB 65.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
154 5/8” x 3/4” Water Meters MM33 Master Meter 95.00 ea no bid ea SRII Sensus 152.00 ea no bid ea
155 1” Turbine Meters MM1 Master Meter 300.00 ea no bid ea SRII Sensus 245.54 ea no bid ea
156 2” Compound Meter 0301-D1-D09 Master Meter 2980.00 ea no bid ea Omni C2 Sensus 1434.81 ea no bid ea
157 3” Compound Meter 0303-D1-D09 Master Meter 3885.00 ea no bid ea Omni C2 Sensus 1995.89 ea no bid ea

158
3/4” Angle Grip Joint In x 3/4” Grip Joint Dual 
Check Valve Straight Out H-14241 Mueller 584.80 ea

HHC11333NL
W1L84 Ford-3 pc 198.00 ea no bid ea BA43232WQNL FORD 56.76 ea

159 Barrel Locks for 3/4” Curb Stops H93180124 Highfield 14.50 ea H93180124 Highfield 10.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
160 Barrel Meter Lock Keys B8610005 Highfield 110.00 ea B8610005 Highfield 95.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
161 Blue Inverted Spray Marking Paint (12 oz.) 04105B Rusto 5.75 ea AER203 Aervoe 6.20 ea no bid ea 555730 (17oz) Rustoleum 5.95 ea

162 Green Inverted Spray Marking Paint (12 oz.) 04106G Rusto 5.75 ea AER204 Aervoe 6.20 ea no bid ea 555724 (17oz) Rustoleum 5.95 ea
163 3/4” Brass Grip Joint In & Out Dual Check Valve 775-208LD AY McDonald 263.00 ea HHCC1333NGC Ford 3pc 175.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

164
3/4” Angle Stop, Grip Joining In x Meter 
Connection Out H-14462 Mueller 162.00 ea BA43232WQNL Ford 74.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

165 1 1/2” Water Meter Turbine Zenner 1548.00 ea BTSM160 no bid ea Omni T2 Sensus 851.00 ea no bid ea
166 2” Water Meter Turbine Zenner 1733.00 ea BTSM200 no bid ea Omni T2 Sensus 1009.41 ea no bid ea
167 3/4” - 1” Meter Box Plastic D1200 DFW 46.00 ea DFW1200 DFW 23.95 ea DFW1200 DFW 23.00 ea no bid ea
168 3/4” - 1” Meter Box Concrete THL SMB 142.00 ea SCH583412 SMB 74.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
169 2” Meter Box Plastic D1500 DFW 79.50 ea DFW1600 DFW 42.90 ea DFW1600 DFW 35.00 ea no bid ea
170 2” Meter Box Concrete TH2 DFW 380.50 ea SCH212 SMB 219.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea
171 3” Water Meter Turbine AA10330101A-1 Zenner 1800.00 ea no bid ea Omni T2 Sensus 1381.40 ea no bid ea
172 3” Compound Meter 0303-E1-D09 Zenner 3792.00 ea no bid ea Omni C2 Sensus 1995.89 ea no bid ea
173 4” Water Meter Turbine A1-A03-0101A-1 Zenner 2645.00 ea no bid ea Omni T2 Sensus 2689.27 ea no bid ea
174 4” Compound Meter 0304-E1-D109 Zenner 6319.00 ea no bid ea Omni C2 Sensus 3466.54 ea no bid ea
175 6” Water Meter Turbine 0303S-E1-D09 Zenner 6597.00 ea no bid ea Omni T2 Sensus 4841.58 ea no bid ea
176 6” Compound Meter 0303S-E1-D09 Zenner 9126.00 ea no bid ea Omni C2 Sensus 5987.65 ea no bid ea

177
3/4” Stainless Steel Insert for CTS Size 
Polyethylene Tubing P134 BWC 4.00 ea PS1SCF Pro 1.34 ea 18347 Matco 1.50 ea no bid ea

178
3/4” Stainless Steel Insert for IPS Size 
Polyethylene Tubing 6138AY BWC 6.00 ea no bid ea 18352 Matco 1.64 ea no bid ea

179
1” Stainless Steel Insert for CTS Size Polyethylene 
Tubing 6138AY BWC 4.00 ea PS1SCG Pro 1.44 ea 18348 Matco 1.17 ea no bid ea

180
1” Stainless Steel Insert for IPS Size Polyethylene 
Tubing 6138AY BWC 7.00 ea no bid ea 18353 Match 1.89 ea no bid ea

181 3/4” x 1/8” Rubber Meter Gasket R308 BWC 1.20 ea PSMCGF ProSelect 0.40 ea no bid ea no bid ea
182 1” x 1/8” Rubber Meter Gasket R308 BWC 1.20 ea PSMCGG ProSelect 0.42 ea no bid ea no bid ea

183
2” x 13” Long C110 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with 
Accessories for Class 160 Pipe T507376 Tyler 210.00 ea MJLSLAK Tyler 90.25 ea no bid ea no bid ea

184
4” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with 
Accessories for Class 160 PVC Pipe T137375 Tyler 210.00 ea MJLSLAP Tyler 77.50 ea DML4 SIGMA 200.11 ea no bid ea
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185
6” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with 
Accessories for Class 160 PVC Pipe T137399 Tyler 300.00 ea MJLSLAU Tyler 130.00 ea DML6 SIGMA 283.08 ea no bid ea

186
8” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with 
Accessories for Class 160 PVC Pipe T137337 Tyler 420.00 ea MJLSLAX Tyler 209.00 ea DML8 SIGMA 415.12 ea no bid ea

187 2" Stainless Steel Inserts for IPS 6138AY BWC 10.60 ea S755DRU Pro 7.50 ea 18356 Matco 3.60 ea no bid ea
188 2" Stainless Steel Inserts for CTS 6138AY BWC 5.10 ea F55K Pro 3.50 ea 18351 Matco 3.57 ea no bid ea
189 2" Meter Flange Gasket and Bolt Kits 2BG EGW 120.00 ea M432T08P  (CI) Matco 43.00 ea no bid ea B43-342WQNL FORD 93.13 ea

190
1" Compression x 3/4" Meter nut Curb Stop (no 
pack joint) 5182-390 AY McDonald 97.19 ea B43342WQNL Ford 104.90 ea no bid ea no bid ea

191
Permanent Automatic Flushing Station with 1" 
piping 9800WC-A Kupferle 4380.00 ea 9800WCA Kupferle 4300.00 ea 9800WC-A Eclipse 3991.46 ea no bid ea

192
Permanent Automatic Flushing Station with 2" 
piping 9800WC Kupferle 4710.00 ea 9800WC Kupferle 4528.00 ea 9800WC Eclipse 4265.85 ea no bid ea

193
Permanent Sampling Station for warm climates 
with A W W A thread or adaptor 88WC-SS Kupferle 980.00 ea 66WCD Kupferle 862.00 ea 88WC-SS Eclipse 927.44 ea no bid ea

194 6" x 1-1/4" Brass Nipple 8601BN ASC 435.00 ea GBRNHU (6'' long) Merit 15.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

195
4” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary 
bolts and gaskets 2000-0563-260 Smith-Blair 230.00 ea K86054010816 Hymax 229.75 ea BOAL-4 Ford 237.38 ea 806-54-0108-16 Hymax 258.68 ea

196
6” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary 
bolts and gaskets 2000-0768-260 Smith-Blair 295.00 ea K86054016316 Hymax 310.00 ea BOAL-6 Ford 314.38 ea 860-54-0163-16 Hymax 342.59 ea

197
8” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary 
bolts and gaskets 2000-0984-260 Smith-Blair 330.00 ea K86054021716 Hymax 350.56 ea BOAL-8 Ford 354.94 ea 860-54-0217-16 Hymax 386.79 ea

198
10” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary 
bolts and gaskets 2000-1200-260 Smith-Blair 425.00 ea K86054027216 Hymax 451.00 ea BOAL-10 Ford 456.61 ea 860-54-0272-16 Hymax 497.58 ea

199
12” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary 
bolts and gaskets 2000-1366-260 Smith-Blair 535.00 ea K86054031516 Hymax 533.00 ea BOAL-12 Ford 541.61 ea 860-54-0315-16 Hymax 587.30 ea

200 6” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS 106-0663 JCM 248.00 ea FBC663 Ford 120.00 ea no bid ea FBC-663 FORD 103.14 ea
201 8” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS 106-0863 JCM 320.00 ea FBC863 Ford 155.00 ea no bid ea FBC-863 FORD 125.75 ea
202 10” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS 106-1063 JCM 590.00 ea FBC1075 Ford 175.00 ea no bid ea FBC-1075 FORD 160.67 ea
203 12” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS 106-1263 JCM 650.00 ea FBC1275 Ford 326.00 ea no bid ea FBC-1275 FORD 183.28 ea

204***
5/8 x 3/4" Positive Displacement Cold Water 
Meter RG3 no bid ea

PD07GBT
(W/TESLA 4 

REGISTER) RG3 251.00 ea RG3 no bid ea no bid ea

205*** AMR/AMI Register RG3 no bid ea
PD07BLUTPD

(REGISTER ONLY) RG3 175.00 ea RG3 no bid ea no bid ea
206 1/2" Sch 80 Pipe PD-800-005 Spears 1.54 ft  no bid ft PD-800-005 SPEARS 26.43 ft no bid ft
207 3/4" Sch 80 Pipe PD-800-007 Spears 2.17 ft no bid ft PD-800-007 SPEARS 35.80 ft no bid ft
208 1" Sch 80 Pipe PD-800-010 Spears 3.08 ft no bid ft PD-800-010 SPEARS 52.66 ft no bid ft
209 1" Sch 80 Pipe, 1' length, threaded on both ends 884-120 Spears 7.33 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
210 1/2" Sch 80 Elbow 90 806-005 Spears 3.92 ea no bid ea 806-005 SPEARS 1.47 ea no bid ea
211 3/4" Sch 80 Elbow 90 806-007 Spears 5.02 ea no bid ea 806-007 SPEARS 1.89 ea no bid ea
212 1" Sch 80 Elbow 90 806-010 Spears 8.08 ea no bid ea 806-010 SPEARS 3.06 ea no bid ea
213 1/2" Sch 80 Tee 801-005 Spears 11.07 ea no bid ea 801-005 SPEARS 4.17 ea no bid ea
214 3/4" Sch 80 Tee 801-007 Spears 11.60 ea no bid ea 801-007 SPEARS 4.37 ea no bid ea
215 1" Sch 80 Tee 801-010 Spears 14.52 ea no bid ea 801-010 SPEARS 5.47 ea no bid ea
216 1/2" Sch 80 4-Way 820-005 Spears 54.58 ea no bid ea 820-005 SPEARS 20.60 ea no bid ea
217 3/4" Sch 80 4-Way 820-007 Spears 57.43 ea no bid ea 820-007 SPEARS 21.68 ea no bid ea
218 1" Sch 80 4-Way 820-010 Spears 67.25 ea no bid ea 820-010 SPEARS 25.39 ea no bid ea
219 1/2" Sch 80 Union Ball Valve 3629-005 Spears 72.88 ea no bid ea 1829-005 SPEARS 78.09 ea no bid ea
220 3/4" Sch 80 Union Ball Valve 3629-007 Spears 86.23 ea no bid ea 1829-007 SPEARS 92.40 ea no bid ea
221 1" Sch 80 Union Ball Valve 3629-010 Spears 102.70 ea no bid ea 1829-010 SPEARS 110.01 ea no bid ea
222 1/2" Sch 80 Union Ball Check Valve 4529-005 Spears 103.32 ea no bid ea 4529-005 SPEARS 88.56 ea no bid ea
223 3/4" Sch 80 Union Ball Check Valve 4529-007 Spears 123.18 ea no bid ea 4529-007 SPEARS 105.59 ea no bid ea
224 1" Sch 80 Union Ball Check Valve 4529-010 Spears 146.55 ea no bid ea 4529-010 SPEARS 125.61 ea no bid ea
225 1/2" Sch 80 Ball Valve 6622-005 Spears 38.80 ea no bid ea 6621-005 SPEARS 29.93 ea no bid ea
226 3/4" Sch 80 Ball Valve 6622-007 Spears 52.93 ea no bid ea 6622-007 SPEARS 40.83 ea no bid ea
227 1" Sch 80 Ball Valve 6622-010 Spears 57.83 ea no bid ea 6622-010 SPEARS 44.61 ea no bid ea
228 1/2" Sch 80 Union 8097-005 Spears 14.35 ea no bid ea 8097-005 SPEARS 5.41 ea no bid ea
229 3/4" Sch 80 Union 8097-007 Spears 18.25 ea no bid ea 8097-007 SPEARS 6.90 ea no bid ea
230 1" Sch 80 Union 8097-010 Spears 20.93 ea no bid ea 8097-010 SPEARS 7.90 ea no bid ea
231 1/2" X 1/4" Sch 80 Threaded Reducer 838-072 Spears 6.28 ea no bid ea 838-072 SPEARS 2.37 ea no bid ea
232 3/4" X 1/4" Sch 80 Reducer 838-101 Spears 4.13 ea no bid ea 838-101 SPEARS 1.56 ea no bid ea
233 1/2” 90 ELL SCH 80 806-005 Spears 3.92 ea no bid ea 806-005 SPEARS 1.47 ea no bid ea
234 1/2” TRUE UNION BALL VALVE SCH 80 3629-005 Spears 72.88 ea no bid ea 1829-005 SPEARS 78.09 ea no bid ea
235 1/2” BALL CHECK VALVE SOC/FIPT SCH 80 4529-005 Spears 103.32 ea no bid ea 4529-005 SPEARS 88.56 ea no bid ea
236 1/2” SCH 80 PVC PIPE PD-800-005 Spears 30.83 ea no bid ea PD-800-005 SPEARS 26.43 ea no bid ea
237 1/2” SCH 80 CLEAR PVC PIPE PD-800-005L-10 Spears 68.50 ea no bid ea PD-800-005L-10 SPEARS 58.71 ea no bid ea
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238 1/2” BALL VALVE SLIP SCH 80 6622-005 Spears 38.80 ea no bid ea 6622-005 SPEARS 29.93 ea no bid ea
239 1/2” BALL VALVE FEMALE SCH 80 6621-005 Spears 38.80 ea no bid ea 6621-005 SPEARS 29.93 ea no bid ea
240 1/2” COUPLING SLIP SCH 80 829-005 Spears 7.10 ea no bid ea 829-005 SPEARS 2.69 ea no bid ea
241 1/2” 4 WAY SCH 80 820-005 Spears 54.58 ea no bid ea 820-005 SPEARS 2.60 ea no bid ea
242 1/2” TEE FEMALE SCH 80 805-005 Spears 12.80 ea no bid ea 801-005 SPEARS 4.17 ea no bid ea
243 1/2” TEE SLIP SCH 80 801-005 Spears 11.07 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
244 1/2” 45 ELL SCH 80 817-005 Spears 7.38 ea no bid ea 817-005 2.79 ea no bid ea
245 1/2” CPVC UNION SCH 80 8097-005C Spears 30.47 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
246 1/2” UNION SLIP SCH 80 8097-005 Spears 14.35 ea no bid ea 8097-005 5.41 ea no bid ea
247 1/2” UNION FEMALE SCH 80 8098-005 Spears 16.68 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
248 1/2” X 1’ SCH 80 PVC PIPE MALE ON ONE SIDE 1882-120 Spears 5.57 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

249 1/2” X 2” SCH 80 PVC PIPE MALE ON BOTH SIDES 882-020 Spears 1.73 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
250 1/2” X 2” SCH 80 PVC PIPE MALE ON ONE SIDE 1882-020 Spears 2.78 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

251
1/2” X 1/4” BUSHING REDUCER SLIP/FEMALE SCH 
80 837-072 Spears 6.28 ea no bid ea 838-072 SPEARS 2.37 ea no bid ea

252 3/4” TRUE UNION BALL VALVE SCH 80 3629-007 Spears 86.23 ea no bid ea 1829-007 SPEARS 92.40 ea no bid ea
253 3/4” TRUE UNION BALL CHECK VALVE SCH 80 4529-007 Spears 123.18 ea no bid ea 4529-007 SPEARS 105.59 ea no bid ea
254 3/4” SCH 80 PVC PIPE PD-800-007 Spears 41.77 ea no bid ea PD-800-007 SPEARS 35.80 ea no bid ea
255 3/4” COUPLING SLIP SCH 80 829-007 Spears 9.62 ea no bid ea 829-007 SPEARS 3.63 ea no bid ea
256 3/4” TEE SLIP SCH 80 801-007 Spears 11.60 ea no bid ea 801-007 SPEARS 4.37 ea no bid ea
257 3/4” 90 ELL SCH 80 806-007 Spears 5.02 ea no bid ea 806-007 SPEARS 1.89 ea no bid ea
258 3/4” UNION SLIP SCH 80 8097-007 Spears 18.25 ea no bid ea 8097-007 6.90 ea no bid ea
259 3/4” SCH 80 CLEAR PVC PIPE PD-800-007L-10 Spears 92.88 ea no bid ea PD-800-007L-10 79.61 ea no bid ea
260 3/4” X 1’ SCH 80 PVC PIPE MALE ON ONE SIDE 1883-120 Spears 6.60 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
261 3/4” X 1/2” SLIP BUSHING REDUCER SCH 80 829-131 Spears 8.72 ea no bid ea 837-101 SPEARS 0.86 ea no bid ea

262
3/4” X 1/2” SLIP/FEMALE BUSHING REDUCER SCH 
80 837-101 Spears 2.28 ea no bid ea 838-101 SPEARS 1.56 ea no bid ea

263 1" TRUE UNION BALL CHECK VALVE CPVC SCH 80 4529-010C Spears 202.72 ea no bid ea 4529-010 SPEARS 125.61 ea no bid ea

264 1' STANDARD BALL VALVE SOC/FIPT CPVC SCH 80 3629-010C Spears 135.65 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
265 1” COUPLING SLIP/FIPT FEMALE SCH 80 835-010 Spears 14.57 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
266 1” 90 ELL SCH 80 806-010 Spears 8.08 ea no bid ea 806-010 SPEARS 3.06 ea no bid ea
267 1” TEE SLIP SCH 80 801-010 Spears 14.52 ea no bid ea 801-010 SPEARS 5.47 ea no bid ea
268 1” SCH 80 PVC PIPE PD-800-010 Spears 61.43 ea no bid ea PD-800-010 SPEARS 52.66 ea no bid ea
269 1” 4 WAY SLIP SCH 80 820-010 Spears 67.25 ea no bid ea 820-010 SPEARS 25.39 ea no bid ea
270 1” COUPLING SLIP SCH 80 829-010 Spears 9.90 ea no bid ea 829-010 SPEARS 3.74 ea no bid ea
271 1” 45 ELL SCH 80 817-010 Spears 16.92 ea no bid ea 817-010 SPEARS 6.39 ea no bid ea
272 1” BALL VALVE UNION SOC/FIPT SCH 80 3629-010 Spears 102.70 ea no bid ea 1829-010 SPEARS 110.01 ea no bid ea
273 1” COUPLING SLIP/FEMALE SCH 80 835-010 Spears 14.57 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea
274 1” X 3/4” COUPLING SLIP SCH 80 829-131 Spears 12.67 ea no bid ea 829-131 SPEARS 4.79 ea no bid ea
275 1” X 1/2” BUSHING REDUCER SCH 80 837-130 Spears 6.57 ea no bid ea 837-130 SPEARS 2.49 ea no bid ea
276 1” X 3/4” FEMALE BUSHING REDUCER SCH 80 838-131 Spears 6.57 ea no bid ea 838-131 SPEARS 2.49 ea no bid ea

277
1” X 1/2” SLIP/FEMALE BUSHING REDUCER SCH 
80 838-130 Spears 6.57 ea no bid ea 838-130 SPEARS 2.49 ea no bid ea

278 1” SCH 80 Y STRAINER YS2AP8-010 Spears 206.28 ea no bid ea YS2AP8-010 SPEARS 176.81 ea no bid ea
279 1” UNION SLIP SCH 80 8097-010 Spears 20.93 ea no bid ea 8097-010 SPEARS 7.90 ea no bid ea
280 1” X 1’ SCH 80 PVC PIPE MALE ON ONE SIDE 1884-120 Spears 7.93 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

281
1 1/2” X 1/2” SLIP/FEMALE BUSHING REDUCER 
SCH 80 838-209 Spears 16.68 ea no bid ea 838-209 SPEARS 6.30 ea no bid ea

282 1 1/2” UNION SLIP SCH 80 8097-015 Spears 46.90 ea no bid ea 8097-015 SPEARS 17.70 ea no bid ea
283 1 1/2” 90 ELL SCH 80 806-015 Spears 11.58 ea no bid ea 806-015 SPEARS 4.37 ea no bid ea
284 1 1/2” TEE SLIP SCH 80 801-015 Spears 39.88 ea no bid ea 801-015 SPEARS 15.06 ea no bid ea
285 2” X 1 1/2” BUSHING REDUCER SLIP SCH 80 837-251 Spears 19.97 ea no bid ea 837-251 SPEARS 7.54 ea no bid ea
286 2” SCH 80 PVC PIPE PD-800-020 Spears 132.47 ea no bid ea PD-800-020 SPEARS 113.54 ea no bid ea
287 2” UNION SLIP SCH 80 8097-020 Spears 63.63 ea no bid ea 8097-020 SPEARS 24.03 ea no bid ea
288 1 1/4" CLEAR PIPE SCH 80 PD-800-012L-10 Spears 187.63 ea no bid ea PD-800-012L-10 SPEARS 160.83 ea no bid ea
289 1 1/2" CLEAR PIPE SCH 80 PD-800-015L-10 Spears 227.88 ea no bid ea PD-800-015L-10 SPEARS 195.33 ea no bid ea
290 2 1/2" CLEAR PIPE SCH 80 PD-800-025L-10 Spears 480.63 ea no bid ea PD-800-025L-10 SPEARS 411.97 ea no bid ea
291 1" IPS BRASS COMPRESSION COUPLING 5182-123 AY McDonald 36.66 ea FC7744NL Ford 62.45 ea no bid ea 015404 Mueller 58.47 ea
292 1" IPS BRASS COMPRESSION TEE 5146-143 AY McDonald 147.43 ea FT777444NL Ford 165.45 ea no bid ea no bid ea
293 3/4" CTS BRASS COMPRESSION TEE 015381 250N Mueller 53.95 ea FT444333NL Ford 58.80 ea no bid ea 015381 Mueller 53.95 ea
294 3/4" IPS PVC BRASS COMPTESSION TEE 015444 250N Mueller 83.22 ea FT777333NL Ford 96.47 ea no bid ea 015444 Mueller 82.28 ea
295 1" IPS PVC BRASS COMPRESSION TEE 9999-999 AY McDonald 147.43 ea FT777444NL Ford 159.84 ea no bid ea no bid ea
296 1" CTS BRASS COMPRESSION TEE 015381 330N Mueller 74.82 ea FT444444NL Ford 63.00 ea no bid ea 015381 Mueller 73.98 ea
297 3/4" - 1" METER BOX LID PLASTIC d1200-lid NDS 12.00 ea DDFW12003RLID DFW 11.15 ea DFW1200 LID DFW 12.50 ea no bid ea
298 2" METER BOX LID PLASTIC D1500-DIRB NDS 55.00 ea DDFW15003RLID DFW 35.00 ea DFW1500 DFW 14.50 ea no bid ea
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Bid Title: Distribution Pipe & Fittings 
Bid Number: SB-2024-PW-126 Final

Effective: July 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024
Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works

Item # Description Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM Product Code Brand Name Price UOM

Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Waterworks Coburns Supply Core & Main LP
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

337-269-0032 337-625-3300 337-474-0526 225-756-4122
Bryan Lavergne Brad Johnson Mark Tate Shane Carson
337-269-1130 F 337-474-0987 F 337-474-0987 (F) 225-756-4144 (F)

blavergne@winwaterworks.com keith.dyson@ferguson.com mtate@coburns.com shane.carson@coreandmain.com

299 3/4" CTS X PVC BRASS COMPRESSION COUPLING 5182-367 AY McDonald 33.34 ea C4733NL Ford 34.75 ea no bid ea no bid ea
300 1" CTS X PVC BRASS COMPRESSION COUPLING 5182-280 AY McDonald 48.19 ea C4744NL Ford 49.20 ea no bid ea no bid ea

301
3" HYMAX REPAIR COUPLINGS WITH ALL 
NECESSARY BOLTS AND GASKETS 2000-0433-260 Smith-Blair 185.00 ea K86054008816 Hymax 184.75 ea no bid ea no bid ea

302
2" HYMAX REPAIR COUPLINGS WITH ALL 
NECESSARY BOLTS AND GASKETS 2000-0303-260 Smith-Blair 145.00 ea K86054005416 Hymax 143.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

303 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Pipe PD-800-012 Spears 84.73 ea no bid ea PD-800-012 SPEARS 72.63 ea no bid ea

304 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Pipe PD-800-015 Spears 95.77 ea no bid ea PD-800-015 SPEARS 82.09 ea no bid ea

305 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Pipe PD-800-025 Spears 223.67 ea no bid ea PD-800-025 SPEARS 191.71 ea no bid ea

306 1" PVC SCH 80 Clear Pipe PD-800-010L-10 Spears 136.00 ea no bid ea PD-800-010L-10 SPEARS 116.57 ea no bid ea

307 2" PVC SCH 80 Clear Pipe PD-800-020L-10 Spears 315.25 ea no bid ea PD-800-020L-10 SPEARS 270.21 ea no bid ea

308 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 90 ELL 806-012 Spears 10.83 ea no bid ea 806-012 SPEARS 4.09 ea no bid ea

309 2" PVC SCH 80 90 ELL 806-020 Spears 14.00 ea no bid ea 806-020 SPEARS 5.29 ea no bid ea

310 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 90 ELL 806-025 Spears 32.77 ea no bid ea 806-025 SPEARS 12.37 ea no bid ea

311 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 45 ELL 817-012 Spears 21.55 ea no bid ea 817-012 SPEARS 8.14 ea no bid ea

312 3/4" PVC SCH 80 45 ELL 817-007 Spears 11.30 ea no bid ea 817-007 SPEARS 4.27 ea no bid ea

313 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 45 ELL 817-015 Spears 25.48 ea no bid ea 817-015 SPEARS 9.63 ea no bid ea

314 2 PVC SCH 80 45 ELL 817-020 Spears 33.05 ea no bid ea 817-020 SPEARS 12.47 ea no bid ea

315 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 45 ELL 817-025 Spears 69.40 ea no bid ea 817-025 SPEARS 26.20 ea no bid ea

316 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Coupling 829-012 Spears 15.05 ea no bid ea 829-012 SPEARS 5.69 ea no bid ea

317 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Coupling 829-015 Spears 16.23 ea no bid ea 829-015 SPEARS 6.13 ea no bid ea

318 2 PVC SCH 80 Coupling 829-020 Spears 17.43 ea no bid ea 829-020 SPEARS 6.59 ea no bid ea

319 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Coupling 829-025 Spears 42.90 ea no bid ea 829-025 SPEARS 16.20 ea no bid ea

320 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-005 Spears 6.65 ea no bid ea 835-005 SPEARS 2.51 ea no bid ea

321 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-007 Spears 9.90 ea no bid ea 835-007 SPEARS 3.74 ea no bid ea

322 1 PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-010 Spears 14.57 ea no bid ea 835-010 SPEARS 5.50 ea no bid ea

323 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-012 Spears 23.60 ea no bid ea 835-012 SPEARS 8.91 ea no bid ea

324 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-010 Spears 28.92 ea no bid ea 835-015 SPEARS 10.91 ea no bid ea

325 2" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-020 Spears 50.47 ea no bid ea 835-020 SPEARS 19.06 ea no bid ea

326 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Female Adapter 835-025 Spears 79.67 ea no bid ea 835-025 SPEARS 30.07 ea no bid ea

327 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-005 Spears 8.32 ea no bid ea 836-005 SPEARS 3.14 ea no bid ea

328 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-007 Spears 9.17 ea no bid ea 836-007 SPEARS 3.46 ea no bid ea

329 1" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-010 Spears 15.85 ea no bid ea 836-010 SPEARS 5.99 ea no bid ea

330 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-012 Spears 18.53 ea no bid ea 836-012 SPEARS 7.00 ea no bid ea
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331 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-015 Spears 26.62 ea no bid ea 806-015 SPEARS 10.04 ea no bid ea

332 2" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-020 Spears 38.50 ea no bid ea 836-020 SPEARS 14.53 ea no bid ea

333 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Male Adapter 836-025 Spears 43.77 ea no bid ea 836-025 SPEARS 16.53 ea no bid ea

334 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Tee 801-012 Spears 39.88 ea no bid ea 801-012 SPEARS 15.06 ea no bid ea

335 2" PVC SCH 80 Tee 801-020 Spears 49.87 ea no bid ea 801-020 SPEARS 18.83 ea no bid ea

336 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Tee 801-025 Spears 54.20 ea no bid ea 801-025 SPEARS 20.46 ea no bid ea

337 2" PVC SCH 80 Union 8097-020 Spears 63.63 ea no bid ea 8097-020 SPEARS 24.03 ea no bid ea

338 2 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Union 8097-025 Spears 101.17 ea no bid ea 8097-025 SPEARS 38.19 ea no bid ea

339 1/2" x 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-072 Spears 9.40 ea no bid ea 830-072 SPEARS 4.04 ea no bid ea

340 1" x 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-131 Spears 12.67 ea no bid ea 829-131 SPEARS 4.79 ea no bid ea

341 1 1/2" x 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-209 Spears 26.93 ea no bid ea 829-209 SPEARS 10.17 ea no bid ea

342 1 1/2" x 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-210 Spears 26.93 ea no bid ea 829-210 SPEARS 10.17 ea no bid ea

343 1 1/2" x 1" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-211 Spears 26.93 ea no bid ea 829-211 SPEARS 10.17 ea no bid ea

344 1 1/2" x 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-212 Spears 33.30 ea no bid ea 829-212 SPEARS 12.57 ea no bid ea

345 2" x 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-247 Spears 30.40 ea no bid ea 829-247 SPEARS 11.47 ea no bid ea

346 2" x 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-248 Spears 30.40 ea no bid ea 829-248 SPEARS 11.47 ea no bid ea

347 2" x 1" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-249 Spears 30.40 ea no bid ea 829-249 SPEARS 11.47 ea no bid ea

348 2" x 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-250 Spears 30.40 ea no bid ea 829-250 SPEARS 11.47 ea no bid ea

349 1 1/4" x 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-166 Spears 25.73 ea no bid ea 829-166 SPEARS 9.71 ea no bid ea

350 1 1/4" x 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-167 Spears 25.73 ea no bid ea 829-167 SPEARS 9.71 ea no bid ea

351 1 1/4" x 1" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-168 Spears 25.73 ea no bid ea 829-168 SPEARS 9.71 ea no bid ea

352 2 1/2" x 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-287 Spears 46.03 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

353 2 1/2" x 3/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-288 Spears 46.03 ea no bid ea 829-288 SPEARS 17.39 ea no bid ea

354 2 1/2 x 1" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-289 Spears 52.02 ea no bid ea 829-289 SPEARS 19.64 ea no bid ea

355 2 1/2" x 1 1/4" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-290 Spears 57.42 ea no bid ea 829-290 SPEARS 21.67 ea no bid ea

356 2 1/2" x 1 1/2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-291 Spears 40.53 ea no bid ea 829-291 SPEARS 15.30 ea no bid ea

357 2 1/2" x 2" PVC SCH 80 Reducer 829-292 Spears 40.53 ea no bid ea 829-292 SPEARS 15.30 ea no bid ea

358 10" x 2" Brass Saddle 4128-035 AY McDonald 234.95 ea S715911007 (160) Ford 239.80 ea no bid ea no bid ea

359 10" x 1" Brass Saddle 4128-011 AY McDonald 234.95 ea S701004 (160) Ford 168.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

360 10" x 3/4" Brass Saddle 4128-010 AY McDonald 234.95 ea S701003 (160) Ford 168.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

361 3/4" x 1" Brass Compression Tee 5182-046 AY McDonald 63.64 ea FT444334NL (CTS) Ford 64.93 ea no bid ea 015831 Mueller 57.53 ea
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362 1/2" Brass Tee no bid ea IBRLFTD (FIP) Merit 3.60 ea BRTD MERIT BRASS 4.00 ea no bid ea

363 1/2" Brass 90 no bid ea IBRLF9D (FIP) Merit 3.65 ea BRLD MERIT BRASS 3.35 ea no bid ea

364 2" Brass Compression Tee 5182-094 AY McDonald 347.77 ea FT444777NL (CTS) Ford 354.91 ea no bid ea 015831 Mueller 334.93 ea

365 2" Brass Tee no bid ea IBRLFTK (FIP) Merit 29.00 ea BRTK MERIT BRASS 29.03 ea no bid ea

366 1" Service Fitting CTS Pack Joint x FIP 5182-063 AY McDonald 28.91 ea FC1444NL Ford 29.50 ea no bid ea P15451 Mueller 29.48 ea

367 2" Service Fitting CTS Pack Joint x FIP 5182-087 AY McDonald 100.13 ea FC1477NL Ford 102.00 ea no bid ea P15451 Mueller 93.63 ea

368 3/4" Service Fitting CTS Pack Joint x FIP 5182-016 AY McDonald 21.32 ea FC1433NL Ford 21.75 ea no bid ea P15451 Mueller 20.61 ea

369 3/4" IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 X4-75250100B ADS 0.35 ea ADS no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

370 3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNFU Merit 7.05 ea BRNFP MERIT BRASS 8.31 ea no bid ea

371 1" x 3/4" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNFCL (3/4 x 1) Merit 2.38 ea BRNGC MERIT BRASS 4.00 ea no bid ea

372 1/2" x 6" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNDU Merit 5.64 ea BRNDP MERIT BRASS 6.25 ea no bid ea

373 1/2" x 3/4" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNDCL (close) Merit 1.65 ea BRNDC MERIT BRASS 2.00 ea no bid ea

374 1/2" x 2" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNDK Merit 2.18 ea BRNDK MERIT BRASS 2.60 ea no bid ea

375 3/4" x 1 1/2" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNFJ Merit 2.53 ea BRNFJ MERIT BRASS 3.00 ea no bid ea

376 1" x 6" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNGU Merit 10.94 ea BRNGP MERIT BRASS 12.13 ea no bid ea

377 1" x 4" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNGP Merit 7.43 ea BRNGN MERIT BRASS 8.24 ea no bid ea

378 3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNFP Merit 5.13 ea BRNFN MERIT BRASS 5.69 ea no bid ea

379 3/4" x 2" Brass Nipple no bid ea GBRNFK Merit 2.99 ea BRNFK MERIT BRASS 3.62 ea no bid ea

380 1" x 3/4" Brass Tee no bid ea IBRLFTGGF (FIP) Merit 12.34 ea BRNGC MERIT BRASS 12.42 ea no bid ea

381
1 1/4" Stainless Steel Inserts for CTS Size 
Polyethylene Tubing no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

382 Auto Hydrant Flusher no bid ea 9700 Kupferle 3040.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

383 1" Brass 90 no bid ea IBRLF9G (FIP) Merit 8.13 ea BRLG MERIT BRASS 6.96 ea no bid ea

384 3/4" Brass 90 no bid ea IBRLF9F (FIP) Merit 4.21 ea BRLF MERIT BRASS 4.51 ea no bid ea

385 5/8" x 3/4" Bottom Load Multi-Jet Master Meter B12-A31-A01-0101A-1 Master Meter 258.77 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

386 1" Bottom Load Multi-Jet Master Meter B16-A31-A01-0101A-1 Master Meter 361.11 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

387
2" Flanged Multi-Jet with Dialog 3G Register 
Master Meter M23-A00-A01-0101A-1 Master Meter 788.21 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

388
1 1/2" Flanged Multi-Jet Meter with Dialog 3G 
Register Master Meter M21-A00-A01-0101A-1 Master Meter 661.56 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

389 5/8" x 3/4" Enhanced 3G Register R-B12-A01-0101-A1-NW Master Meter 198.64 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

390 3G XTR Coder w/Nicor Connect 199-024-50 Master Meter 135.90 ea no bid ea no bid ea no bid ea

391 3/4" CTS Ultra Tite Coupling/Insta-Tite Coupler 5194-003 AY McDonald 30.08 ea C4433UNL Ford 25.19 ea no bid ea 015406 Mueller 28.76 ea

392 1" CTS Ultra Tite Coupling/Insta-Tite Coupler 5194-007 AY McDonald 35.44 ea C4444UNL Ford 28.75 ea no bid ea 015406 Mueller 31.31 ea
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393 3" Brass Swing Check Valve no bid ea PFX31M Proflo 107.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

394 4" Brass Swing Check Valve no bid ea PFX31P Proflo 179.00 ea no bid ea no bid ea

CATEGORY # CATEGORIES
1 SCH 40 PVC FITTINGS
2 SCH 80 PVC FITTINGS
3 BRASS FITTINGS
4 METERS
5 SERVICE TUBING
6 PIPE
7 MECHANICAL JOINT FITTINGS
8 VALVES
9 OTHER

30% 25% no bid no bid

Additional Items Percentage off
%DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE 

FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT*
%DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE 

FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT*
%DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE 

FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT*
%DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURED LIST PRICE 

FOR ANY ITEMS ADDED TO CONTRACT*

30% no bid no bid no bid
10% 10% no bid no bid
0% 10% no bid no bid

10% 25% no bid no bid
0% 0% no bid no bid

10% 10% no bid no bid
10% 10% no bid no bid
0% 0% no bid no bid
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