Bid Title: Metal & Aluminum Pipes & Fittings Vendor Vendor
Bid unice Coastal Culver upply
Number: SB-2024-PW-132 Final Inc. Coburn Supply
Terry Brown Michael Self
Effective: July 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024 tbrown@coastalculvert.com mself@coburns.com
Dept Pers: Division of Engineering & Public Works 337-546-6887 225-369-3395
337-546-6889 337-474-0987
10% Pref 10% Pref
BID AMT BID AMT
[CORRUGATED METAL
Item #|ROUND PIPE (Price Per Foot) Brand Name: Brand Name:
SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
1 72 10 3”X1” 356.83 357.60
2 84 10 3"X1” 418.00 418.91
3 96 10 3”X1” 479.18 480.21
4 108 10 3”X1” 537.80 538.96
5 120 10 3”X1” 596.42 597.71
CURRUUARIED METAL
ROUND PIPE (Price per 24 " Band) Brand Name: Brand Name:
SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
6 72 10 3”X1” 1,070.50 1,072.82
7 84 10 3”X1” 1,254.01 1,256.70
8 96 10 3”X1” 1,437.53 1,440.60
9 108 10 3”X1” 1,613.39 1,616.80
10 120 10 3”X1” 1,789.26 1,793.10
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF BAND: Contech Contech
CORRUGATED METAL
ARCHED PIPE (Price Per Foot) Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
11 17x13 15 14 2-2/3"x1/2” 42.77 42.85
12 21x15 18 14 2-2/3”x1/2” 51.33 51.44
13 28x20 24 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 94.10 94.30
14 35x24 30 12 2-2/3”x1/2” 116.91 117.16
15 42x29 36 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 139.72 140.00
16 49x33 42 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 178.79 179.15
17 57x38 48 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 203.88 204.30
18 60x46 54 12 3”x1” 260.34 260.90
19 66x51 60 12 3”x1” 301.69 302.30
20 81x59 72 10 37x1” 479.05 480.00
21 95 x 67 84 10 3"x1” 584.56 585.80
22 112x75 96 10 37x1” 688.82 690.30
23 128 x 83 108 10 3"x1” 773.08 774.70
24 142x91 120 10 37x1” 891.65 893.55
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CORRUGATED METAL
ARCHED PIPE (Price per24 " Band) Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
25 17x13 15 14 2-2/3"x1/2” 45.00. 128.57
26 21x15 18 14 2-2/3”x1/2” 55.00. 154.33
27 28x20 24 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 100.00. 282.91
28 35x24 30 12 2-2/3”x1/2” 120.00. 351.48
29 42x29 36 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 150.00. 420.00
30 49x33 42 12 2-2/3”x1/2” 190.00. 537.50
31 57x38 48 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 215.00. 612.95
32 60x46 54 12 37x1” 280.00. 782.70
33 66x51 60 12 3”x1” 322.00. 907.00
34 81x59 72 10 37x1” 510.00. 1,440.25
35 95 x67 84 10 3”x1” 600.00. 1,757.45
36 112x75 96 10 37x1” 720.00 2,070.90
37 128x 83 108 10 3" x1” 825.00 2,324.25
38 142x91 120 10 3"x1” 950.00 2,680.75
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF BAND: Contech Contech
39 12” Riser 14 gauge onto 15” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 705.00 630.43
40 15” Riser 14 gauge onto 18” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 776.57 778.26
41 15” Riser 14 gauge onto 24” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 946.85 948.91
42 TEES FOR ARCHED PIPE 15” Riser 14 gauge onto 30” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,037.96 1,040.21
43 24” Riser 14 gauge onto 36” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,649.67 1,653.26
44 24” Riser 14 gauge onto 42” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,805.86 1,809.78
45 24” Riser 14 gauge onto 48” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,906.72 1,910.86
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF TEE: Contech Contech
46 GEOTEXTILE FABRIC 24” x 120 Yard Roll 195.00 No Bid
47 = 36” x 120 Yard Roll 230.00 No Bid
ggzzl;i":;i?‘ﬁiﬁgzl‘;it) Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE SIZE  GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
48 2-2/3"x1/2" 18 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 41.59 41.68
49 2-2/3"x1/2" 24 12 2-2/3"x 1/2" 76.14 76.30
50 2-2/3"x1/2" 30 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 95.17 95.38
51 2-2/3"x1/2" 36 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 114.91 115.16
ROUND PIPE (Price per 24 " Band) Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION G CoifEE
52 2-2/3"x1/2" 18 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 135.00 125.05
53 2-2/3"x1/2" 24 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 248.00 228.91
54 2-2/3"x1/2" 30 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 300.00 286.14
55 2-2/3"x1/2" 36 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 380.00 345.48
SPECIFY NAME BRAND OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY NAME BRAND OF BAND: Contech Contech
SPECIFY CORE ALLOY: 3004 3004- (H32 or H34)
SPECIFYCLAD ALLOY: 7072 7072
ALUMINIZED STEEL PIPE TYPE 2 (Price per Foot and Band) Brand Name:
Brand Name:
DIAMETER _ GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
PRICE/FOOT 15" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 31.00 31.06
56 PRICE/BAND 15" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 100.00 93.19
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PRICE/FOOT 18" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 37.20 37.28
57 PRICE/BAND 18" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 120.00 111.84
PRICE/FOOT 24" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 68.19 68.33
58 PRICE/BAND 24" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 215.00 205.00
PRICE/FOOT 30" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 84.73 84.91
59 PRICE/BAND 30" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 265.00 254.73
PRICE/FOOT 36" 12 2-2/3"x 1/2" 101.26 101.47
60 PRICE/BAND 36" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 325.00 304.43
PRICE/FOOT 42" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 129.57 129.84
61 PRICE/BAND 42" 12 2-2/3"x 1/2" 405.00 389.54
PRICE/FOOT 48" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 147.75 148.00
62 PRICE/BAND 48" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 460.00 444.22
PRICE/FOOT 54" 12 3"x1" 188.67 189.05
63 PRICE/BAND 54" 12 3"x1" 600.00 567.22
PRICE/FOOT 60" 12 3"x1" 218.63 219.08
64 PRICE/BAND 60" 12 3"x1" 700.00 657.32
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF BAND: Contech Contech
CORRUGATED ALUMINUM
ROUND PIPE (Price Per Foot) _ Brand Name: Brand Name:
SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
65 12 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 22.56 22.60
66 15 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 28.20 28.26
67 18 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 33.84 33.91
68 21 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 39.48 39.56
69 24 14 2-2/3”x 1/2” 55.69 55.81
70 30 14 2-2/3”x 1/2” 69.09 69.20
71 36 12 2-2/3”x 1/2” 114.91 115.12
72 42 12 2-2/3”x 1/2” 133.95 134.20
73 48 10 2-2/3”x 1/2” 194.58 195.00
74 54 10 3”x1” 253.09 253.60
75 60 8 3”x1” No Bid No Bid
CORRUGATED ALUMINUM
ROUND PIPE (Price per 24 " Band) Brand Name: Brand Name:
SIZE GAUGE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
76 12 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 85.00 67.82
77 15 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 95.00 84.78
78 18 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 115.00 101.70
79 21 16 2-2/3”x 1/2” 130.00 118.69
80 24 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 175.00 167.40
81 30 14 2-2/3”x 1/2” 220.00 207.68
82 36 12 2-2/37x 1/2” 360.00 345.45
83 42 12 2-2/3”x 1/2” 422.00 402.68
84 48 10 2-2/3”x 1/2” 605.00 585.00
85 54 10 3’x1” 800.00 760.90
86 60 8 3”x1” No Bid No Bid
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF BAND: Contech Contech
CORRUGATED ALUMINU™ Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCHED PIPE (Price per foot) Contech Contech
Size (in) [Span x Rise] Corrugation | Gauge
87 15-[17 x 13] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 16 31.33 31.40
88 18 - [21 x 15] 2-2/37x 1/2” 16 37.60 37.65

Page 3 of 5




Bid Title: Metal & Aluminum Pipes & Fittings Vendor Vendor
Bid unice Coastal Culver upply
Number: SB-2024-PW-132 Final Inc. Coburn Supply
Terry Brown Michael Self
Effective: July 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024 tbrown@coastalculvert.com mself@coburns.com
Dept Pers: Division of Engineering & Public Works 337-546-6887 225-369-3395
337-546-6889 337-474-0987
10% Pref 10% Pref
89 21 -[24 x 18] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 16 43.86 43.95
90 24 - 128 x 20] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 14 61.89 62.00
91 30 - [35 x 24] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 14 76.77 76.90
92 36 - [42 x 29] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 12 127.68 127.90
93 42 - [49 x 33] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 12 148.83 149.12
94 48 - [57 x 38] 2-2/3”x1/2°| 10 216.19 216.60
95 54 - [64 x 43] 37x1” 10 281.21 281.80
96 60 - [71 x 47 37x1” 8 No Bid No Bid
(GYHHUET AL Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCHED PIPE (Price Per Band) Contech Contech
Size (in) [Span x Rise] Corrugation | Gauge
97 15-[17 x 13] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 16 100.00 94.20
98 18 - [21 x 15] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 16 120.00 113.00
99 21 -[24 x 18] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 16 140.00 131.80
100 24 - 128 x 20] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 14 199.00 186.00
101 30 - [35 x 24] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 14 250.00 230.80
102 36 - [42 x 29] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 12 400.00 383.82
103 42 - [49 x 33] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 12 500.00 447.40
104 48 - [57 x 38] 2-2/3”x 1/2” 10 700.00 649.95
105 54 - [64 x 43] 37x1” 10 900.00 845.45
106 60 - [71 x 47] 37x1” 8 No Bid No Bid
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF PIPE: Contech Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF BAND: Contech Contech
Brand Name: Brand Name:
ROUND ALUMINUM TEE Contech Contech
Size (diameter, in.) Corrugation | Gauge
107 12 2-2/37x1/2 | 14 323.21 323.90
108 15 2-2/37x1/2” | 14 399.13 400.00
109 18 2-2/37x1/2” | 14 484.82 485.80
110 24 2-2/37x1/2” | 12 568.33 569.54
111 30 2-2/37x1/2” | 12 831.89 833.65
112 36 2-2/37x1/2” | 12 1523.86 1527.15
113 42 2-2/37x1/2” | 12 1780.91 1784.75
114 48 2-2/37x1/2” | 12 2398.05 2403.25
115 54 3’x1” 12 3607.38 3615.18
116 60 37x 17 12 No Bid No Bid
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF TEE: Contech Contech
Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH ALUMINUM TEE Contech Contech
Size (diameter, in.) Corrugation | Gauge
117 15 2-2/37x1/2” 14 467.46 468.45
118 18 2-2/3"x1/2” 14 568.33 569.55
119 24 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 849.24 851.05
120 30 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 1050.98 1053.25
121 36 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 1536.88 1540.20
122 42 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 2126.90 2131.50
123 48 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 2880.69 2886.90
124 54 37x1” 12 4351.41 4360.85
125 60 37x1” 12 No Bid No Bid
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF TEE: Contech Contech
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Brand Name: Brand Name:
CAST IRON RING AND GRATE Contech Contech
Size (diameter, in.) Corrugation | Gauge
126 12 2-2/3"x1/2” 14 204.99 205.43
127 15 2-2/3"x1/2” 14 260.30 260.86
128 18 2-2/3"x1/2” 14 309.11 309.78
129 24 2-2/3"x1/2” 12 585.68 586.95
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF RING: SIP Contech
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF GRATE: SIP Contech
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