
Bid Title Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

Bid Number Rentokil North America Inc dba
Target Specialty Products

VM Distribution Partners, a div of 
Aslpundh Tree Expert LLC Orion Solutions LLC Red River Specialties LLC Nutrien AG Solutions

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
Heritage Landscape Supply 

Group, Inc

Effective Period Steve Longwell Sloan Everitt Kevin Evans Chad Chambliss Wes Flower Gail Sloan Jeff Baker

225.939-9169 601-616-2491 832-328-4734 409-224-9332 281-590-5041 337-288-8128 207-606-9119

steve.longwell@target-specialty.com Non Responsive kevans@theorioncompanies.us chad.chambliss@azelis.com wesley.flower@nutrien.com  sloang@helenaagri.com jeff.baker@heritageppg.com

Kirsti.Rodney@Target-Specialty.com orders@vmdistributionpartners.com Troak@theorioncompanies.us yancy.meguess@azelis.com jim.crosby@nutrien.com thibodeauxn@helenaagri.com miles.rivera@heritageppg.com

Item Container Size list on bid Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon

250 Gallon No Bid 16.60. $9.81 $14.98 $15.60 $17.50 $13.99

30 Gallon $15.53 $16.90 $13.25 $14.98 $15.80 $17.54 $14.83
Lead time 14-21 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days Alligare 2,4-D Amine

Product Offered Alligare Amine 2,4-D Albaugh 2,4-D amine 4 2, 4-D Amine Weedar 64 Alligare 2, 4-D Amine Weedar 64 5 Days ARO

2.5 Gallon $16.02 $14.95 $14.13 $15.24 $16.15 $14.78 $14.94

265 Gallon $17.85 $14.45 $11.88 $14.48 $15.40 $14.36 $13.84
Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Ranger Pro Albaugh Gly Star Plus Credit 41 Extra Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro

2.5 Gallon $22.73 $20.69 $22.35 $18.92 $21.20 $20.76 $18.27

265 Gallon $24.38 $19.96 $19.89 $17.76 $20.90 $19.28 $17.16

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Roundup Pro Concentrate Bayer Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate

2.5 gallon $25.88 $24.29 $21.26 $23.40 $24.68 $24.40 $22.95

265 Gallon $27.62 $23.15 $20.17 $22.16 $23.70 $23.35 $21.83

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Roundup Pro Concentrate Bayer Aquamaster Aquaneat Aquamaster Round up Custom Roundup Custom Roundup Custom

250 Gallon 63.836  (2.5 gal container) $54.20 $56.68 $55.24 $63.90 $62.50 $54.34

Lead time 14-21 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Nufarm Polaris Nufarm Polaris Ecomazapyr 2SL Arsenal Herbicide Nufarm Polaris Ecomazapyr 2SL Ecomazapyr 2 SL (2.5 gal)

1 Gallon or 2.5 Gallon 21.26 (2.5 gal container) $38.20 $16.39 $17.44 $26.00 $35.57 $19.75

Lead time 7-10 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered TS Pro Pacific Blue Milliken Bullseye dye Novita Super Marking Dye RRSI IVM Marking Dye Turf Trax Blue Spray Indicator Mystic Spi Blue (2.5 gal)

2.5 Gallon $39.80 $11.40 $9.82 $10.48 $10.85 $18.48 $10.86

Lead time 7-10 Days ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO
Product Offered Turf Fuel The Works VM T6-90 Novita MVO Xtra RRSI NIS Brewer 90-10 Inlet Windsurf Pro

2.5 Gallon No Bid $17.30 $13.25 No Bid $17.45 $17.80 $14.83

250 Gallon No Bid $16.60 $9.81 No Bid $17.00 $17.50 $13.99

Lead time No Bid 7 business days 2-5 days No Bid 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO
Product Offered No Bid Albaugh 2,4-D amine 4 2, 4-D Amine No Bid Platoon Weedar 64 2, 4-D Amine (Alligare)

1 Pint No Bid No Bid $5.00/qt No Bid No Bid 10.80 (quart) No Bid

1 Gallon No Bid No Bid $20.00 $10.44 $14.20 $35.87 $30.00

Lead time No Bid No Bid 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO
Product Offered No Bid No Bid Novita Drift Control RRSI 1% Drift Control Reign Promate Accuracy Droplex

Price Per Gallon $16.25 No Bid $9.40 $10.48 $10.85 No Bid $24.95

Lead time 7-10 Days ARO No Bid 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days No Bid 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Halo 80 No Bid Novita Down Force RRSI NIS Brewer 90-10 No Bid Aircover

No less than 265 Gallon No Bid $36.20 $31.77 $34.00 $25.50 $25.60 $35.27

Lead time No Bid  7 business days 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2-5 Days 3-5 working days 5 Days ARO
Product Offered No Bid Drexel MSMA 6+ MSMA 6+ MSMA 6 Plus Drexel Target 6 Plus Target 6 Plus Target MSMA 6 Plus

2.5 Gallon $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Esplanade 200SC Esplanade 200 SC Esplanade 200SC Esplanade 200 SC Esplanade 200 SC Esplanade 200 SC Esplanade 200 SC

2.5 gallon $56.22 $36.95 $32.70 $48.88 $37.40 $37.50 $47.82

250 gallon No Bid No Bid $30.52 No Bid $37.40 $37.50 $47.82

Lead time 14-21 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Triclopyr  3 Cortera Element 3A Alligare Triclopyr 3 Element 3a  Triclopyr 4 Truckiotr 3 Element 3

250 Gallon No Bid $93.00 94.01 $99.95 $100.05 $107.00 $93.47

Lead time No Bid 7 business days 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered No Bid Nufarm Polaris AC Alligare Imazapyr 4SL Arsenal AC Polaris AC Polaris AC Complete Imazapyr 4L

XIII Triclopyr 3 or Equivalent

XIV Polaris Ac Complete or Equivalent

X
RRSI NIS Surfactant or Equivalent: Active Ingredients: 100% 
Alkylarylpolyethylene glycols, free fatty acids, and components 

ineffective as an adjuvant.

XI Target 6 Plus or equivalent

XII. Esplanade 200 SC or Equivalent

VII Induce or Equivalent 90% active non-ionic surfactant labeled for 
Aquatic

VIII Platoon or Equivalent: 

IX V-Drift Adjuvant or Equivalent:

IV

Roundup Custom or Equivalent: For Aquatic.  Active Ingredient: 
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine, in the form of its 

isopropylamine salt.. 53.8% Other Ingredients: 46.   The 
Awarded Bidder must supply electric pump for entire term of 

the contract.

V Nufarm Polaris or Equivalent

VI Promate Trail Blazer Dye or Equivalent:

I 2-4-D Amine type liquid, complete as per specifications (DOTD# 
10-94-1050)

II Ranger Pro or Equivalent:
41% active ingredient

III Roundup Pro Concentrate, complete as per specifications 
(DOTD# 10-94-1920)

Herbicides and Weed Control Chemicals
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August 2, 2024 until January 31, 2025
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Bid Title Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

Bid Number Rentokil North America Inc dba
Target Specialty Products

VM Distribution Partners, a div of 
Aslpundh Tree Expert LLC Orion Solutions LLC Red River Specialties LLC Nutrien AG Solutions

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
Heritage Landscape Supply 

Group, Inc

Effective Period Steve Longwell Sloan Everitt Kevin Evans Chad Chambliss Wes Flower Gail Sloan Jeff Baker

225.939-9169 601-616-2491 832-328-4734 409-224-9332 281-590-5041 337-288-8128 207-606-9119

steve.longwell@target-specialty.com Non Responsive kevans@theorioncompanies.us chad.chambliss@azelis.com wesley.flower@nutrien.com  sloang@helenaagri.com jeff.baker@heritageppg.com
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Item Container Size list on bid Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon

          

Herbicides and Weed Control Chemicals

SB-2024-PW-142

August 2, 2024 until January 31, 2025

Description

250 Gallon No Bid $34.20 $29.16 34.48 (265 gal tote) $44.05 $36.00 $39.94

Lead time No Bid 7 business days 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2.-5 days 2-5 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered No Bid Albaugh Dicamba DMA Diablo Nufarm/Clash Herbicide Nufarm Clash Dicamba 4 Dicamba HD (2.5 gal)

250 Gallon $55.68 $59.75 $59.95 $69.88 $68.00 $68.00 $85.86

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2-5 Days 2-5 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Triumph 22k Tordon 22K Tordon 22K Tordon 22k Triumph 22K Triumph 22k Tordon 22K

1 Gallon No Bid No Bid $804.42 $738.00 $738.00 No Bid $751.32

Lead time No Bid No Bid 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days No Bid 5 Days ARO

Product Offered No Bid No Bid Detail Detail Detail No Bid Detail

15 Gallon $124.10 No Bid $98.54 $115.88 $111.88 114.90 (4 x 1 gal) 115.21 (2.5 gal)

Lead time 14-21 Aro No Bid 2-5 days 5 days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Panoramic 2SL No Bid Panormaic Plateau Plateau Panoramic 2 SL Panoramic 2SL

2.5 Gallon $357.12 $357.12 $357.12 $357.12 $357.12 $357.12 $357.12

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Method 240 SL Envu method 240SL Method 240SL Method 240 SL Method 240 SL Method 240 SL Method 240SL

60 oz. $1,240.32/gl 9.69 (per ounce) $9.69 9.69 (per ounce) 9.69 (per ounce) $9.69 (per ounce) 581.40/gl

Lead time 10-14 ARO 7 business days 2-5 days 3-5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-5 days 5 Days ARO

Product Offered Derigo Envu Derigo Derigo Derigo Derigo Derigo Derigo

XIX Methaod 240 SL or Equivalent

XX Derigo or Equivalent

XVI Triumph 22K or Equivalent

XVII Detial or Equivalent: Active Ingredient; 29.74a% Saflufenacil

XVIII Plateaur or Equivalent

XV Dicamba HD or Equivalent
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