
Bid Number: SB-2024-PW-146 
Effective Period: October 3, 2024 until March 1, 2025
 Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works (Stormwater)

Item# Description EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50
1 Radio Transmitter – Programmed to 171.025 350.00 350.00 350.00 446.00 446.00 446.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

2a Solar Panel - 5W Solar Panel, with mounting bracket, hardware, 
and minimum 15-foot cable. No bid No bid No bid 189.75 189.75 172.35 No bid No bid No bid 259.40 246.43 246.43

2b Solar Panel – 10W Solar Panel, with mounting bracket, hardware, and 
minimum 15-foot cable. No bid No bid No bid 235.00 235.00 211.95 No bid No bid No bid 379.00 322.15 303.20

3a Antennas
VHF Omni-directional No bid No bid No bid 111.12 111.12 111.12 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand and model number (if different): 

3b GPS No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

4 Surge Protector – DC blocked, Polyphaser IS-50 or equal No bid No bid No bid 285.00 285.00 256.50 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

5 Rain Gauge Section / Tipping Bucket No bid No bid No bid 758.65 758.65 684.15 730.00 730.00 730.00 779.00 740.05 740.05

6a Standard Pressure Transducer – SDI-12 including 50-foot 
vented cable No bid No bid No bid 986.00 986.00 901.00 No bid No bid No bid 1298.87 1233.93 1233.93

`

6b Rugged Pressure Transducer – 50’ cable No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 1298.87 1233.93 1233.93

6c Price per additional foot of vented cable No bid No bid No bid 2.74 2.74 2.74 No bid No bid No bid 1.77 1.77 1.77

7a Radar – Water Level Sensor No bid No bid No bid 2862.00 2862.00 2575.80 1999.00 1999.00 1999.00 2009.00 2009.00 2009.00

`
7b Radar – Surface Velocity No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 3698.00 3698.00 3698.00 No bid No bid No bid

8a ALERT2 Encoder and Modulator 1850.00 1850.00 1750.00 690.00 690.00 621.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

8b Data Logger No bid No bid No bid 1100.00 1100.00 990.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

9 Bubbler Sensor – Water level sensor No bid No bid No bid 3995.00 3995.00 3591.00 No bid No bid No bid 2567.00 2567.00 2567.00

10 All-In-One Sensor No bid No bid No bid 2028.00 2028.00 1827.50 No bid No bid No bid 3095.00 2231.50 2321.50

11 Wind Sensor – as specified No Bid No Bid No bid 1446.00 1446.00 1346.00 No bid No bid No bid 1586.00 1586.00 1586.00

12 Transmitter Package – as specified 2300.00 2300.00 2200.00 2960.00 2960.00 2664.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

13 Accessory Package – as specified No bid No bid No bid 2446.00 2446.00 2446.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Secondary Contact Julie Van Wie 720-252-4300 julie@bluewaterdesign.com Tammy Nelson  435-227-9828  tnelson@campbellsci.com Matt Steager  561-459-4876 matt.steager@kisters.net William Ho 800-949-3766 FSSupport@otthydromet.com

Brand name and Model Number: CSI SA-798
Primary Contact David Van Wie 720-334-7358 vanwie@bluewaterdesign.com David Odd  435-227-9522 dodd@campbellsci.com Dave Procyk  512-993-1941  davie.procyk@kisters.net Jeremy Thompson  601-467-0361  jeremy.thompson@otthydromet.com

Brand name and Model Number: Gill Windsonic4 WS200 Weather Sensor SDI-12 Wind

Brand name and Model Number: Blue Water Design A2RT-RTU-BP CSI Alert205-F1-P-NA

Brand Name and Model Number: CSI LevelVueB10-50 Includes com cable, desiccator kit
and orifice line end cap CBS 5mm accuracy and 50' range

Brand name and Model Number: CSI ClimaVue50-10-PT All in one sensor Weather Station

Brand Name and Model Number: Blue Water Design A2RT CSI AL200

Brand Name and Model Number: CSI CR350 (direct replacement for CR300)

Brand Name and Model Number: CSI CS475A-L200-PT HyQuant L 50 OTT Hydromet Water Level Radar Sensor

Brand Name and Model Number: HyQuant L+V (Q upgrade)

Brand Name and Model Number: Texas Electronics TR-525 includes 
CSI CM270 mounting bracket HyQuest Solutions/ KISTERS TB4 Rain Gauge 205mm Tipping Bucket Rain Gauge with 

Siphon, 0.01 inch

Brand Name and Model Number: CSI CS451-50-SA-SN
PLS 500 Submersible Pressure Transducer with 50' 

cable and FAD 4

Brand Name and Model Number: Polyphaser IS-50

Brand Name and Model Number: Ameresco 5W 3911-1050; 2271-1037; 6411-1017-3

Brand Name and Model Number: Ameresco 10W 10 Watt Solar panel, 15' cable and mount

Brand Name and Model Number: Ritron DTX-145 Maxon 125E V2

720-334-7358 435-227-9000 916-723-1441 x430 800-949-3766

vanwie@bluewaterdesign.us tony.coventry@campbellsci.com kna@kisters.net sales@otthydromet.com

Bid Item: Water Level Monitoring Station Parts Blue Water Design Technologies LLC Cambell Scientific , Inc KISTERS North America
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     

OTT Hydromet Corp
David Van Wie Antony Coventry Rebecca Susan Emery Brandt Hellstern
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